



March 16, 2009

MEMORANDUM

TO: District Board of Trustees
FROM: William D. Law, Jr., President
SUBJECT: Attorney Invoices

Attorney invoices totaling \$15,251.90 for the period January 1, 2009, through February 20, 2009, are recommended for approval.

Attorney fees and expenses charged in fiscal year 2008-09 through February 20, 2009, total \$63,964.45.

Details are attached for information purposes.

STAFF RESOURCE: TERESA SMITH

RECOMMENDED ACTION:
Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

Johnson, Farrell & Mabile, LLC

115 N. Calhoun Street
Tallahassee, FL 32301
Tax ID # 11-3799979

February 6, 2009
Billing through 01/31/2009

Invoice# 1205 WRM
Our file# T00007 02276

Tallahassee Community College
Jerry Schilling
Assistant VP for Administrative Services
444 Appleyard Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32304-2895

Tallahassee Community College - General Business

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

01/05/2009	WRM	0.40	hrs.	50.00
Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Nerona-Balog re: request for student information (.1); E-mail to K. Nerona-Balog re: request for student information (.1); Telephone conference with P. Scanlon re: request for student information (.2);				
01/06/2009	WRM	2.30	hrs.	287.50
Receipt and review of two e-mails from K. Nerona-Balog re: request for student records (.2); Two e-mails to K. Nerona-Balog re: request for student records (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Lesko re: DCCCD Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: FSU Institute of Library Science Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from B. Sloan re: MindLeaders Contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: student issue (.1); Review e-mails re: student issue (.2); E-mail to S. Jefferson re: student issue (.1); Review and analysis of DCCCD Agreement (.5); E-mail to B. Sloan re: DCCCD Agreement (.1); Review and analysis of FSU Institute of Library Science Agreement (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: FSU Institute of Library Science Agreement (.1);				
01/06/2009	WRM	1.20	hrs.	150.00
Two Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: FCHR/DOAH claims (.4); Review and analysis of Mindleaders Contract (.7); E-mail to B. Sloan re: MindLeaders Contract (.1);				
01/07/2009	WRM	1.80	hrs.	225.00
Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: student issue (.1); E-mail to S. Jefferson re: student issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: public records request exceptions (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: public records request exceptions (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini Lease (.1); Receipt and review of FCHR complaint with attachments (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.1); E-mail to S. Jefferson re: FCHR complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T.				

T00007	Tallahassee Community College	Invoice# 1205	Page 2
	Smith re: Apple Professional Services Contract (.1); Review and analysis of Apple Professional Services Contract (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: Apple Professional Services Contract (.1);		
01/08/2009	WRM	5.90 hrs.	737.50
	Receipt and review of two e-mails from S. Jefferson re: FCHR complaint (.2); Two e-mails to S. Jefferson re: FCHR complaint (.2); Receipt and review of two e-mails from S. Jefferson re: student issue (.3); Two e-mails to S. Jefferson re: student issue (.2); Conference with B. Law re: employee issue and Ghazvini Center (.5); Two Telephone conferences with J. Schilling re: FCHR complaint (.2); Telephone conference with J. Davis re: DOAH matter (.2); Receipt and review of documents re: organization recognition (.3); Analysis of timing and stages for organization recognition (3.8);		
01/09/2009	WRM	4.90 hrs.	612.50
	E-mail to B. Law re: organizational law and procedure (.3); Preparation for various meetings with TCC administrators (.9); Several conferences with T. Smith, S. Jefferson, J. Schilling, T. Stallworth, and R. Lipscomb re: varied topics- including campus organization, FCHR complaint, injury claim, and Ghazvini lease (3.2); Review and analysis of documents re: FCHR claim (.5);		
01/12/2009	WRM	1.70 hrs.	212.50
	Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Easley re: DMS contract (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.2); Review and analysis of TCC/DMS state employee training agreement (.4); E-mail to C. Easley re: DMS contract (.1); Telephone conference with J. Davis re: DOAH hearing (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan and others re: DOAH hearing (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from S. Search re: DOAH hearing (.2); E-mail to S. Search re: DOAH hearing (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from B. Sloan re: DOAH hearing (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: DOAH hearing (.1);		
01/13/2009	WRM	1.60 hrs.	200.00
	Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR claim (.1); Review documents for preparation of FCHR response (1.5);		
01/13/2009	WRM	0.90 hrs.	112.50
	Review e-mail from V. Mayes re: DOAH hearing (.1); E-mail to V. Mayes re: DOAH hearing (.1); Receipt and review of scheduling matter/pre-hearing order in DOAH (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to petitioner re: DOAH hearing (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to B. Sloan re: DOAH hearing (.2); Receipt and review of order in DOAH procedure (.1);		
01/15/2009	WRM	6.70 hrs.	837.50
	E-mail to S. Jefferson and R. Tolson re: response to FCHR complaint (.1); Review e-mail from C. Easley re: DMS contract for computer software training (.1); Analysis of final version of TCC/DMS computer software training agreement (.4); E-mail to C. Easley re: TCC/DMS computer software training agreement (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee transfer (.1); Review documents for preparation of response to FCHR claim (2.6); Dictation and preparation of draft affidavits and initial		

T00007 Tallahassee Community College	Invoice# 1205	Page 3
position on FCHR response (3.3);		
01/16/2009 WRM	0.60 hrs.	75.00
Dictation and preparation of affidavit for use with response to FCHR claim (.4); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: affidavit in response to FCHR claim (.2);		
01/19/2009 WRM	6.80 hrs.	850.00
Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: response to FCHR complaint (.1); Dictation and preparation of affidavits in support of response to FCHR complaint, draft responses to FCHR complaint and supporting documents (6.7);		
01/20/2009 WRM	6.70 hrs.	837.50
Two telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: FCHR response (.3); Telephone conference with L. Mathis re: FCHR response (.1); Telephone conference with A. Dalmau re: MOU-Score (.1); Review and analysis of Score MOU (.3); Four e-mails to A. Dalmau re: Score MOU (.4); Receipt and review of five e-mails from A. Dalmau re: Score MOU (.5); Continued preparation of response and document in support of response to FCHR complaint (3.4); Conference with R. Tolson re: documents in support of response to FCHR complaint (1.0); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Lesko re: McGraw Hill Letter of Agreement (.1); Review and analysis of McGraw Hill Letter of Agreement (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: McGraw Hill Letter of Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: response to FCHR complaint (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: response to FCHR complain (.1);		
01/21/2009 WRM	1.80 hrs.	225.00
Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: McGraw Hill Letter of Agreement (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: document in response to FCHR complaint (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to petitioner re: DOAH hearing (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: document in support of response to FCHR complaint (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: information for use in FCHR response (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from B. Lesko re: Visix Software Maintenance and Supply Agreement (.2); Review and analysis of Visix Software Agreement (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: affidavit for support of response to FCHR claim (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: 07-08 EEO 6 Report (.1); Review revised affidavit for submission to FCHR (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: revised affidavit for submission to FCHR (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: Visix Software Agreement (.1);		
01/23/2009 WRM	0.20 hrs.	25.00
Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: Visix Software Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: New Foundation Policies (.1);		
01/26/2009 WRM	6.20 hrs.	775.00
Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: response to FCHR complaint (.1); Receipt and review of agenda for 1-26-09 Board meeting (.5); Review e-mail from J.G. re: pre-DOAH hearing meeting (.1); E-mail to petitioner re: pre-DOAH hearing meeting (.1); Continued preparation of		

T00007	Tallahassee Community College	Invoice# 1205	Page 4
	FCHR response (2.7); Conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR response (.4); Attend 1-26-08 Board meeting (2.3);		
01/27/2009	WRM	3.20 hrs.	400.00
	Review e-mail from petitioner re: DOAH hearing (.1); E-mail to petitioner re: DOAH hearing (.1); Review e-mail from B. Holliman re: Tech@Nite trademark (.1); E-mail to B. Holliman re: Tech@Nite trademark (.1); E-mail to J. Chapin re: Tech@Nite trademark (.1); Review e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Subway lease (.1); Review e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini Center site plan with attachments (.2); Review e-mail from T. Smith re: Subway lease (.1); Two telephone conferences with R. Johnston re: Portofino security system complaint (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to M. Haney re: Ghazvini Center lease (.3); Review e-mail from R. Johnston re: Portofino security system complaint (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Portofino security system complaint (.1); Review Portofino security system complaint with attachments (.5); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: Portofino security system complaint (.2); Review e-mail from A. Dalmau re: WFP/TCC Transition Center MOU (.1); Analysis of proposed Foundation policies (.8);		
01/28/2009	WRM	2.60 hrs.	325.00
	Review e-mail from complainant re: DOAH hearing (.1); Review and analysis of TCC/EWO agreement with Workforce Plus (.3); Two e-mails to A. Dalmau re: TCC/EWO Workforce Plus agreement (.3); Receipt and review of caselaw re: FCHR complaint (.2); Review e-mail from A. Dalman re: TCC/EWO Workforce Plus agreement (.1); Review two e-mails from M. Turnbull re: Portofino security system suit (.2); Review e-mail from R. Johnston re: Portofino security system suit (.1); Review e-mail from R. Tolson re: whistleblower suit (.1); Three e-mails to R. Johnston and M. Turnbull re: Portofino security case (.3); Review new whistleblower complaint (.2); Two telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: new whistleblower complaint (.2); E-mail to R. Johnston re: proposed Foundation policies (.3); Analysis of continued proposed Foundation policies (.2);		
01/30/2009	WRM	6.90 hrs.	862.50
	Review e-mail from R. Johnston re: Foundation policies (.1); Review e-mail from K. Nerona-Balog re: public records request (.1); Telephone conference with K. Nerona-Balog re: public records request (.1); E-mail to K. Nerona-Balog re: public records request (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Foundation security company suit (.2); Review e-mail from J. Schilling re: DOT grant lease to Ferrell Rentals (.1); Review and analysis of DOT grant lease to Ferrell Rentals (.2); E-mail to J. Schilling re: DOT grant lease to Ferrell Rentals (.1); Review e-mail from B. Law re: faculty organization (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: faculty organization (.1); Review and analysis of Foundation and other documents re: security company suit (4.3); Telephone conference with B. Law re: faculty organization (.1); Conference with R. Johnston and M. Turnbull re: Foundation security company suit (1.3);		
01/30/2009	WRM	7.10 hrs.	887.50
	Review e-mail from K. Nerona-Balog re: public records request (.1);		

Telephone conference with B. Law re: faculty organization (.2); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Foundation security company suit (.2); Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: Foundation security company suit (.1); Telephone conference with L. Burgess re: public records request (.1); Two telephone conferences with R. Hamm re: faculty organization (.3); Conference with Bill Law re: faculty organization (.4); Conference with J. Schilling re: Ferrell rental lease (.2); Review and analysis of TCC documents re: property transfer in 2001, property sale in 2006, Foundation/housing DSO suit (5.3); Review e-mail from T. Smith re: faculty organization (.1); E-mail to complainant in DOAH matter (.1);

Total Fees	\$8,687.50
-------------------	-------------------

EXPENSES

12/30/2008	E105	Long distance telephone (actual charges) - conference with Chris Davis.	0.90
01/05/2009	E105	Long distance telephone (actual charges) - conference with Chris Davis.	0.15
01/06/2009	E105	Long distance telephone (actual charges) - conference with Chris Davis.	0.15
01/21/2009	E101	Copy Charges 7 - copies at .10 each	0.70

Total Expenses	\$1.90
-----------------------	---------------

Billing Summary - Summary by Timekeeper

Mabile, William R.	69.50 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$8,687.50
TOTAL	69.50 hrs		\$8,687.50

Total fees for this matter	\$8,687.50
-----------------------------------	-------------------

Total disbursements for this matter	\$1.90
--------------------------------------------	---------------

Total balance now due	\$8,689.40
------------------------------	-------------------

Fees Billed Fiscal Year to Date	57,152.50
----------------------------------------	------------------

Expenses Billed Fiscal Year to Date	249.45
--------------------------------------------	---------------

Fees Received Fiscal Year to Date	36,392.50
------------------------------------------	------------------

Expenses Received Fiscal Year to Date	32.30
----------------------------------------------	--------------

Johnson, Farrell & Mabile, LLC

115 N. Calhoun Street
Tallahassee, FL 32301
Tax ID # 11-3799979

February 23, 2009
Billing through 02/20/2009

Invoice# 1215 WRM
Our file# T00007 02276

Tallahassee Community College
Jerry Schilling
Assistant VP for Administrative Services
444 Appleyard Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32304-2895

Tallahassee Community College - General Business

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

02/02/2009	WRM	1.00	hrs.	125.00
Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: class withdrawal/repeat (.1); Review and analysis of rule/law re: class withdrawal/repeat (.9);				
02/03/2009	WRM	2.30	hrs.	287.50
Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Nerona-Balog re: course-withdrawal and repeat (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails re: complaint in DOAH matter re: hearing planning (.2); Two e-mails to petitioner re: DOAH matter-hearing plan (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan, S. Search, and others re: DOAH hearing (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: file for DOAH matter (.1); Review documents for use at DOAH hearing (1.0); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini lease (.1); Analysis of validity of extension of Subway lease (.4); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Subway lease (.1);				
02/04/2009	WRM	2.60	hrs.	325.00
Receipt and review of two e-mails from T. Stallworth re: Subway lease (.2); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Subway lease (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from R. Tolson re: DOAH petitioner's file (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: DOAH petitioner's file (.1); Telephone conference with Heather from President's office re: 2-5-09 meeting (.1); Conference with R. Tolson re: DOAH petition (.8); Receipt and review of PERC documents re: faculty organization (.3); Review statutes and rules cited in PERC documents (.8);				
02/05/2009	WRM	7.60	hrs.	950.00
Review and analysis of documents and exhibits for DOAH hearing and prepare for meeting with petitioner (3.1); E-mail to B. Sloan and others re: DOAH hearing preparation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Mayes re: DOAH hearing preparation (.1); E-mail to V. Mayes re: DOAH hearing preparation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Biron re: TalEval contract (.1); E-mail to C. Biron re: TalEval contract (.1); Review, documents, strategies, and rules re: faculty organization for today's meeting (1.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: DOAH hearing (.1); Attend meeting with B. Law and others re: faculty				

02/06/2009	WRM	3.10 hrs.	387.50	Receipt and review of two e-mails from B. Law re: PERC documents with five documents (.4); Receipt and review of two e-mails from D. Heekin re: PERC documents (.2); Conference with petitioner in DOAH matter (.8); Telephone conference with B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.1); Two telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.2); E-mail to S. Search re: DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of three e-mails from D. Heekin re: PERC matter (.3); E-mail to D. Heekin re: PERC matter (.1); Telephone conference with B. Law re: PERC matter (.2); E-mail to petitioner in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: PERC matter (.1); Legal analysis for security company suit re: portofino contract (.5);
02/09/2009	WRM	1.70 hrs.	212.50	Receipt and review of two e-mails from T. Stallworth re: Subway lease (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: DOAH hearing (.1); Telephone conference with B. Sloan re: DOAH hearing (.1); Telephone conference with B. Law and B. Sloan re: faculty advice and DOAH matter (.1); Review Subway lease amendments (02,07) (.1); Telephone conference with T. Stallworth re: Subway lease and Ghazvini Center (.2); Telephone conference with G. Porges re: class withdrawal and report (.1); Telephone conference with S. Lathem re: security company suit (.1); Telephone conference with T. Gray re: new whistleblower suit (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: new whistleblower suit (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: student information (.1); Receipt and review of two e-mails from D. Heekin re: appearance in PERC matter (.2); E-mail to D. Heekin re: appearance in PERC matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Biron re: dental hygiene grading system (.1);
02/09/2009	WRM	1.90 hrs.	237.50	Dictation and preparation of Motion for Continuance in DOAH matter (.3); Telephone conference with B. Avchen re: dental hygiene grading system copyright (.2); Receipt and review of two e-mails from R. Johnston re: security company suit (.2); Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: security company suit (.1); E-mail to R. Johnston re: security company suit (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: possible employee grievances (.2); Telephone conference with R. Bush re: whistleblower suit (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Bush re: whistleblower suit (.1); Review policies specific reference for staff grievances (.3); Receipt and review of correspondence from D. Godsill re: whistleblower suit (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: whistleblower suit (.1);
02/10/2009	WRM	2.20 hrs.	275.00	Analysis of security company law suit and defense strategy (.8); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to the petitioner in DOAH matter (.4); Analysis of resolution of DOAH matter (.8); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: security company lawsuit (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: security company lawsuit (.1);
02/10/2009	WRM	3.40 hrs.	425.00	Receipt and review of three e-mails from D. Heekin re: faculty

organization (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: faculty representation (.1); Revise motion for continuance in DOAH matter (.1); Outline concepts resolution in DOAH matter (.2); Conference with B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.5); Conference with R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.8); Receipt and review of four e-mails from B. Law re: security organization (.4); E-mail to B. Law re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: faculty organization (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with B. Sloan re: faculty organization and DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: faculty organization (.1); Telephone conference with B. Lesko re: faculty organization (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to petitioner in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to R. Johnston and M. Turnbull re: security company suit (.2);

02/11/2009 WRM 7.50 hrs. 937.50

Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: DOAH matter resolution (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: DOAH matter resolution (.1); Two e-mails to M. Turnbull re: security company suit (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: security company suit (.1); Revise draft correspondence to petitioner in DOAH matter (.2); Telephone conference with B. Sloan re: student test request (.1); Carry out activities to move to dismiss Network security v. TCC Foundation, including legal analysis, preparation of motion, affidavit, correspondence to Network attorneys, and revise documents (5.6); Review and analysis of Practical Nurse License requirements (.2); Analysis of withdrawal from class and forgiveness (.8); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1);

02/12/2009 WRM 2.20 hrs. 275.00

Receipt and review of two e-mails from D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.3); E-mail to D. Heekin re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: public record request (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: public record request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of three e-mails from B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.3); E-mail to B. Law and B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.1); Two e-mails to B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.2); E-mail to K. Nerona-Balog re: class withdrawal and repeat (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: whistleblower complaint (.1); Telephone conference with K. Nerona-Balog re: class withdrawal and repeat (.2); E-mail to S. Jefferson re: student lab participation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Nerona-Balog re: class withdrawal and repeat (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: public record request (.2);

02/12/2009 WRM 4.30 hrs. 537.50

Analysis of current public request for board member information (1.9); Conference with R. Tolson and T. Gray re: whistleblower suit (1.1); Conference with T. Smith re: DOH contract employee (.2); Conference with M. Turnbull re: security company suit against TCC Foundation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: faculty organization (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from P. Locascio re: FTC Identity Theft rules (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to T. Smith and R. Tolson re: FTC Identity Theft rules (.1); Receipt and review of

T00007	Tallahassee Community College	Invoice# 1215	Page 4
	e-mail from T. Smith re: DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: FTC Identity Theft rules (.1); Two telephone conferences with S. Prouty re: class withdrawal (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: DOAH matter (.1);		
02/12/2009	WRM	1.00 hrs.	125.00
	Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: former employee solicitation activity with attachments (.2); E-mail to R. Johnston re: former employee solicitation activity (.1); E-mail to T. Tolson re: former employee solicitation activity (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: class withdrawal and repeat (.1); Revise Motion to Dismiss security company suit (.5);		
02/13/2009	WRM	2.50 hrs.	312.50
	Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: public record request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: class withdrawal (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: former employee correspondence (.1); Receipt and review of correspondence from former employee (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: former employee's activities (.1); Two telephone conferences with R. Johnston re: former employee's activities (.2); Receipt and review of two e-mails from R. Tolson re: former employee's activities (.2); E-mail to R. Johnston re: former employee's activities (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to former employee re: cease and desist activities (.3); Two e-mails to R. Tolson re: former employee's activities (.2); Finalize motion to dismiss and letter and attachments re: security company suit (.6); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to R. Johnston re: motion to dismiss security company suit (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from P. Locascio re: FTC Red Flag Identity Theft Rules (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: FTC Red Flag Identity Theft Rules (.1);		
02/13/2009	WRM	1.40 hrs.	175.00
	Telephone conference with B. Sloan and L. Ewen re: public records request (.2); E-mail to B. Law re: public records request (.1); Revise resolution correspondence to petitioner in DOAH matter (.3); Review February 16, 2009 Board Meeting Agenda (.6); Telephone conference with B. Law re: public records request (.2);		
02/16/2009	WRM	3.50 hrs.	437.50
	Two e-mails to D. Heekin re: Bryant, Miller, Olive presentation (.1); Review e-mail from D. Heekin re: Bryant, Miller, Olive presentation (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: Bryant, Miller, Olive engagement (.1); Review and analysis of Attorney General's 2007 opinion re: public records request (.2); Review e-mail from B. Law re: Bryant, Miller, Olive engagement (.1); Conference with B. Law re: Bryant, Miller, Olive engagement (.2); Attend TCC Board workshop and meeting (2.7);		
02/18/2009	WRM	0.30 hrs.	37.50
	Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: various (3) employee issues;		
02/19/2009	WRM	1.40 hrs.	175.00
	E-mails to and from R. Tolson re: potential grievance (with attachment) and disability retirement (.3); Review e-mail from P. Locascio re: facilities use policy (.1); E-mails to and from R. Johnston re: endowment payout and security company suit (.5); Review e-mail from petitioner in		

DOAH matter (.1); E-mails to and from B. Abner re: security company suit (.2); Review 2 e-mails from C. Easley re: OSHA courses (.2);

02/19/2009 WRM 2.30 hrs. 287.50

Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: potential grievance (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to B. Law re: BMO proposal (.3); Review and analysis of American Safety Council Agreement (OSHA) (.6); Prepare e-mail to C. Easley re: same (.1); Begin review of UMIFA - spending from endowment (1.0); Prepare e-mail to R. Johnston re: UMIFA - spending from endowment (.1); Review e-mail from B. Leinback re: employee contracts (.1);

02/20/2009 WRM 0.30 hrs. 37.50

Telephone conferences with R. Johnston re: spending from endowment;

Total Fees \$6,562.50

Billing Summary - Summary by Timekeeper

Mabile, William R.	52.50 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$6,562.50
TOTAL	52.50 hrs		\$6,562.50

Total fees for this matter	\$6,562.50
Total disbursements for this matter	\$0.00
Total balance now due	\$6,562.50

Fees Billed Fiscal Year to Date	63,715.00
Expenses Billed Fiscal Year to Date	249.45
Fees Received Fiscal Year to Date	50,130.00
Expenses Received Fiscal Year to Date	194.65