



June 22, 2009

M E M O R A N D U M

TO: District Board of Trustees
FROM: William D. Law, Jr., President
SUBJECT: Attorney Invoice – June – Bryant, Miller, Olive

Item Description:

Request for approval to pay the attorney fees.

Overview:

On an as needed basis, The College engages an attorney specializing labor relations and the attorney submits an invoice for services provided.

Salient Facts:

The attorney is hired by the Board under the authority of Section 1001.64(25), Florida Statutes, and for this reason invoices are brought for approval.

Past Actions:

Attorney fees and expenses charged in fiscal year 2008-2009, through April 30, 2009 total \$24,217.99.

Future Actions:

Monthly invoices will be presented as they are submitted by the attorney.

Funding/Financial Matters:

Funding is budgeted in Fund 1, the Current Unrestricted Fund. The current amount due is \$7,249.75.

Staff Resource:

Teresa Smith

Recommended Action:

Authorize payment of invoice as presented.

Bryant Miller Olive

Tallahassee Community College
William R. Mabile
Esquire
c/o Johnson, Farrell & Mabile, LLC
115 North Calhoun Street
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Statement Date: May 14, 2009
Statement No. 43688
Client No. 25480.001

For professional services rendered and expenses incurred
regarding UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign

Statement of Legal Services

			Hours	
04/01/2009	TBP	Telephone conference with D. Heekin, W. Law, B. Sloan and B. Mabile regarding UFF, unit and consent election agreement; follow-up research regarding eligible voter list and absentee ballots	0.80	No Charge
04/01/2009	DMH	Telephone conference and emails with client and opposing counsel regarding consent election agreement	0.90	
04/02/2009	TBP	Follow-up research regarding eligible voter list and absentee ballots; compile information required for consent election agreement	4.00	
04/02/2009	JCC	Review documents regarding election	0.60	
04/02/2009	DMH	Draft Consent Election Agreement	1.00	
04/02/2009	DMH	Review research regarding eligibility list, absentee ballot, and date of eligibility	0.60	
04/02/2009	DMH	Telephone conference and emails with client and opposing counsel	0.20	
04/03/2009	TBP	Assist in compilation of information required for consent election agreement	0.50	
04/03/2009	DMH	Review and reply to emails regarding election issues	0.30	
04/06/2009	DMH	Review and reply to emails from opposing counsel; review draft of stipulations	0.30	
04/07/2009	DMH	Telephone conference client, review file and documents, revise stipulations	0.80	

Statement Date: May 14, 2009
Statement No. 43688
Client No. 25480.001

Tallahassee Community College

04/13/2009	DMH	Analyze public records issue	0.20
04/13/2009	LMR	Research University of Florida's website and organizational chart for procedures for public records requests; contact general counsel's office for copies of Babb/UF briefs and arbitrator's ruling	1.30
04/14/2009	DMH	Telephone conferences with PERC (x3)	0.60
04/14/2009	DMH	Review and reply to emails with client and opposing counsel	0.40
04/14/2009	DMH	Draft joint stipulation between the parties	1.60
04/15/2009	DMH	Telephone conference client	0.20
04/15/2009	DMH	Review and reply to emails/client and opposing counsel	0.20
04/15/2009	DMH	Revise joint stipulation	0.60
04/16/2009	DMH	Telephone conferences with PERC	0.20
04/16/2009	DMH	Review and reply to email	0.10
04/16/2009	DMH	Review filing	0.10
04/16/2009	DMH	Review correspondence	0.10
04/20/2009	DMH	Review order and draft email regarding procedure	0.80
04/20/2009	DMH	Review correspondence and rules	0.50
04/20/2009	DMH	Legal research/UF case	0.30
04/20/2009	DMH	Telephone conferences with PERC	0.40
04/20/2009	DMH	Analyze election issues	0.90
04/21/2009	DMH	Review documents -- UF opinion & briefs; PERC orders	0.80
04/21/2009	DMH	Review and reply to emails	0.50
04/21/2009	DMH	Prepare for telephone conference with client	0.50
04/21/2009	DMH	Telephone conference with client regarding election	1.00
04/21/2009	DMH	Telephone conference with PERC	0.20
04/22/2009	DMH	Review packet of union materials	2.50
04/22/2009	DMH	Telephone conference PERC	0.10
04/23/2009	DMH	Review and reply to emails	0.50
04/23/2009	DMH	Review eligibility list	0.20
04/23/2009	DMH	Telephone conference PERC	0.10
04/24/2009	DMH	Review eligibility list and resolve issues related thereto	1.10
04/24/2009	DMH	Telephone conferences with PERC	0.30

	Statement Date:	May 14, 2009
	Statement No.	43688
Tallahassee Community College	Client No.	25480.001
04/24/2009 DMH Telephone conference client		0.20
04/24/2009 LMR Review/compare election voter lists		0.50
04/27/2009 DMH Telephone conference Mabile		0.10
04/28/2009 DMH Telephone conference client and review and reply to emails		0.40
04/29/2009 DMH Telephone conference client		0.10
04/29/2009 DMH Attend pre-election conference via telephone		0.80
04/30/2009 DMH Telephone conferences with PERC and client		0.20
04/30/2009 DMH Review documents regarding absentee ballot and order		0.40
04/30/2009 DMH Review and reply to emails		0.10
Current Services		<u>28.30</u>
		<u>\$7,075.00</u>
Total Non-billable Hours		0.80
 Net Fees after Billing Adjustment		<u><u>\$7,075.00</u></u>

	Recapitulation		
<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Total</u>
Theresa B. Proctor	4.50	\$250.00	\$1,125.00
James C. Crosland	0.60	\$250.00	\$150.00
Denise M. Heekin	21.40	\$250.00	\$5,350.00
Linda M. Russell	1.80	\$250.00	\$450.00

Expenses Incurred	
Fax	19.00
Westlaw research	149.09
Duplication	5.50
Postage	0.42
Long distance	0.34
 Thru 04/30/2009	<u><u>\$174.35</u></u>

Tallahassee Community College	Statement Date:	May 14, 2009
	Statement No.	43688
	Client No.	25480.001
Total Current Work		<u>7,249.35</u>
Previous Balance Due		16,968.64
Balance Due		<u>\$24,217.99</u>

Please Reference Client Number On Checks And Wire Transfers

Mail Checks to:
101 North Monroe Street, Suite 900
Tallahassee, FL 32301

Send wire transfers to Capital City Bank, ABA #063100688
for credit to Bryant Miller Olive, Account #0293793601,
Attr: Bill Colledge
Thank you for your business

Bryant Miller Olive P.A.

Listing with Transaction No

Search Description:

cost and statement no=ask user ('statement no')

Date	Prof	MatterID/Client Sort Matter Description Narrative	Transaction Number	Units	Price	Value
Component: Dup						
		BRR 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/21/2009				
Open		Duplication	362894	6.0000	0.2500	1.5000
		BRR 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/24/2009				
Open		Duplication	364964	5.0000	0.2500	1.2500
		BRR 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/24/2009				
Open		Duplication	364965	5.0000	0.2500	1.2500
		BRR 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/24/2009				
Open		Duplication	364966	5.0000	0.2500	1.2500
		BRR 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/27/2009				
Open		Duplication	365581	1.0000	0.2500	0.2500
		Component: Dup		22.0000		5.5000
Component: Fax						
		25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/13/2009				
Open		Fax	359631	2.0000	1.0000	2.0000
		BRR 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/24/2009				
Open		Fax	365121	11.0000	1.0000	11.0000
		BRR 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/24/2009				
Open		Fax	365122	6.0000	1.0000	6.0000
		Component: Fax		19.0000		19.0000

Bryant Miller Olive P.A.
Listing with Transaction No

Search Description:
cost and statement no=ask user ('statement no')

Date	Prof	MatterID/Client Sort Matter Description Narrative	Transaction Number	Units	Price	Value
Component: LD						
DMH 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/23/2009						
Open		Long distance 8504888641	364502	2.0000	0.1700	0.3400
			Component: LD	2.0000		0.3400
Component: Post						
BRR 25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 4/24/2009						
Open		Postage	365124	1.0000	0.4200	0.4200
			Component: Post	1.0000		0.4200
Component: West						
25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 3/25/2009						
Open		Check issued to: West Payment Center for West Law	367063	1.0000	103.6200	103.6200
25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 3/21/2009						
Open		Check issued to: West Payment Center for West Law	367067	1.0000	25.7900	25.7900
25480.001 / Tallahassee Community College Tallahassee Community College -UFF 2009 Organizing Campaign 3/22/2009						
Open		Check issued to: West Payment Center for West Law	367068	1.0000	19.6800	19.6800
			Component: West	3.0000		149.0900
			Grand Total	47.0000		174.3500