



August 17, 2009

MEMORANDUM

TO: District Board of Trustees
FROM: William D. Law, Jr., President
SUBJECT: Attorney Invoice - Andrews, Crabtree, Knox & Andrews, LLP
6/30/2009

Item Description:

Request for approval to pay the Board's attorney.

Overview:

On a monthly basis, the Board's attorney submits an invoice for services provided.

Salient Facts:

The College's attorney is hired by the Board under the authority of Section 1001.64 (25), Florida Statutes, and for this reason invoices are brought for approval.

Past Actions:

Attorney fees and expenses charged in fiscal year 2008-2009, through 06/30/09 total \$117,867.50.

Future Actions:

Monthly invoices will be presented as they are submitted by the attorney.

Funding/Financial Matters:

Funding is budgeted in Fund 1, the Current Unrestricted Fund. The current amount due is \$17,455.65

Staff Resource:

Teresa Smith

Recommended Action:

Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

ANDREWS, CRABTREE, KNOX & ANDREWS, LLP

P.O. BOX 12800
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32309
TAX ID #59-3621660

July 8, 2009

Jerry Schilling
Assistant Vice President for Administrative Services
Tallahassee Community College
444 Appleyard Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32304

Invoice# 8499 WRM
Our file# T00007 02276
Billing through 06/30/2009

Tallahassee Community College (General)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

05/18/2009	WT	Prepare notice of production from non-party and subpoena to Dr. Casey Schmidt in DOAH matter;	0.30 hrs.	12.00
05/19/2009	WT	Prepare notice of production from non-party and subpoena to Tallahassee Memorial Regional Medical Center Behavioral Health Center (.3); Search Leon County court records re: litigation history on petitioner (.2); Research ADHD medications to determine if any cause photosensitivity (.4); Begin preparation of interrogatories and request for production to petitioner, all in DOAH matter (.9)	1.80 hrs.	72.00
05/20/2009	WT	Finish preparation of initial interrogatories and request for production in DOAH matter;	0.70 hrs.	28.00
05/21/2009	WT	Preparation of correspondence to B. Sloan and T. Smith re: outcome of faculty union vote;	0.10 hrs.	4.00
05/28/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of case law and statutes re: claims under the ADA and accommodations required in DOAH matter;	2.60 hrs.	325.00
05/28/2009	WRM	Telephone conferences with B. Lesko re: DOAH matter records (.2); Telephone conferences with M. Haney re: Ghazvini's lease - indemnity (.4); Receipt and review of	1.80 hrs.	225.00

e-mail from C. Biron re: copyright issue (.1); Preparation for meeting with B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.3); Conference with B. Sloan re: DOAH matter documents (.6); E-mail to B. Hollimon re: copyright issue (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re; Ghazvini - lease insurance (.1);

05/29/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of case law and statutes re: claims under the ADA and accommodations required for DOAH matter;	3.50 hrs.	437.50
05/29/2009	WRM	E-mail to J. Schilling re: THF service agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: employee issue, with attachment (.2); E-mail to J. Schilling re: employee issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Ghazvini lease indemnity provision (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hebrock re: professional services contracts (.1); E-mail to B. Hebrock re: professional services contracts (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: professional service contracts (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: vendor lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease indemnity provision (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Schilling proposed service agreement with THF with agreement (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smtih re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease indemnity (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hollimon re: copyright issue (.1); E-mail to B. Hollimon re: copyright issue (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan/C. Biron re: copyright issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Biron re: copyright issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: copyright issue (.1); Analysis: proposed changes to insurance provision in Ghazvini Lease (.5); E-mail to J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: lease agreement (.1);	5.50 hrs.	687.50

Analysis: proposed changes to indemnity provision in Ghazvini Lease (.7); E-mails (2) to M. Haney re: proposed changes to indemnity provision in Ghazvini Lease (.2); Review documents to provide to petitioner per document request in DOAH matter (.9); Review second revision to Ghazvini lease indemnity provision (.1); E-mail to T. Smith./J. Schilling re: second revision to Ghazvini Lease indemnity provision (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: DOAH record production (.1); Dictation and preparation of response to notice to produce in DOAH matter (.4);

06/01/2009	WT	Finish preparation of documents for production in response to amended notice of production in DOAH matter;	2.60 hrs.	104.00
06/01/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hebrock re: professional contracts (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: vendor lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: GCSB facility agreement (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: THF agreement (.2); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: THF agreement (.2); Review and analysis of GCSB facility agreement (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: GCSB facility agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail lfrom G. Wells re: BMO invoice (.1); Telephone conference with B. Hollimon re: possible copyright infringement (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: possible copyright infringement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: GCSB facility agreement (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: several human resources issues (.3); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: GCSB facility agreement (.1); Telephone conferences with G. Wells re: BMO invoice (.2); Review and analysis of caselaw re: DOAH matter (1.7); Receipt and review of	7.80 hrs.	975.00

e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini Lease (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini Lease (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Analysis of documents in DOAH matter (3.5); Telephone conference with K. Moore re: information request (.1);

06/02/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: Ghazvini lease insurance (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Biron re: possible copyright infringement (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan/B. Hollimon re: possible copyright infringement (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease insurance (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: contract renewal (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hollimon re: possible copyright infringement (.1); Telephone conference with B. Law re: development question, professional services agreements, employee issue (.3); Review and analysis of financial disclosure requirements - Board Members (.9); E-mail to S. Taylor re: financial disclosure requirements (.1); Analysis of development question, funding, program (.8); Telephone conferences with J. Chapin development question (2 calls) (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: contract renewal (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Ghazvini lease, employee issue (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: development questions (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolton re: employee issue, DROP question (.2); Telephone conference with J. Murdaugh re: personnel procedure question (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: personnel procedure issue (.1);	3.90 hrs.	487.50
06/03/2009	WT	Finalize documents responsive to notice to produce;	0.40 hrs.	16.00
06/03/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from Board member re: President's evaluation with attachment (.2); Receipt and review of FCHR determination of no cause in employee	3.50 hrs.	437.50

termination complaint (.3); Preparation - final documents to petitioner in DOAH matter (1.0); Review and sign subpoenas (2) for medical records of petitioner in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Capitol Center Lease (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: lease request/outside job (.1); Telephone conference with K. Holmes re: financial disclosure (.1); E-mail to K. Holmes re: financial disclosure (.1); Receipt and review of Capitol Center Lease form (.6); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: Capitol Center Lease form (.2); Telephone conference with K. Moore re: financial disclosure (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to R. Tolson re: FCHR no cause determination (.3); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to T. Gray re: FCHR no cause determination (.2); Review and sign response to request to produce in DOAH matter (.1);

06/04/2009	WRM	E-mails (4) to V. Mayes re: her deposition in DOAH matter (.4); E-mail to B. Sloan re: status/activities in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to T. Smith/R. Tolson re: status/activities in DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: outside employment questions (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from V. Mayes re: her deposition in DOAH matter (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Ghazvini Lease and vender lease, and professional services (.3); E-mail to B. Law re: Ghazvini Lease (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: development question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Search re: DOAH matter depositions (.2); E-mail to S. Search re: DOAH matter depositions (.1);	1.80 hrs.	225.00
06/05/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of case law re: temporal proximity of employment decisions in FCHR matter;	1.10 hrs.	137.50

06/05/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: DOAH matter depositions (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Mayes re: DOAH matter deposition (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); E-mails (6) to M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson with attached new FCHR claim (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR claim (.1); Telephone conferences with J. Schilling re: development questions (2 calls) (.3); Telephone conferences with J. Murdaugh re: outside employment (2 calls) (.3); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: vending machine request for production (.1); Telephone conference with A. Maxwell re: new FCHR claim (.1); E-mails (2) to J. Murdaugh/R. Tolson re: new FCHR claim (.2); Continuing analysis of development proposal (.8); E-mail to B. Law re: development proposal (.1); Telephone conference with M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.2); Telephone conference with G. Wells re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Review and analysis of case law re: new FCHR claim (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (6) from M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.7); Telephone conferences with J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (6 calls) (.6); E-mail to J. Schilling/T. Smith re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: education project (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Review and analysis of changes to Ghazvini Lease provisions (.4); E-mail to T. Smith/J. Schilling re: "final" version Ghazvini Lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Ghazvini Lease - final (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Ghazvini Lease - final (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: professional services contract (.1); Receipt and	6.60 hrs.	825.00
------------	-----	---	-----------	--------

review of e-mails (2) from T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini Lease property description (.2); E-mails (2) to T. Stallworth re: Ghazvini property description (.2); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini property description (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Ghazvini property description (.1);

06/08/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee grievance with two attachments (.2); Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: employee grievance, FCHR determination, FCHR response, contract employees (.4); Review and sign CCLA computer policy (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from medical record custodian - DOAH matter (.1);	0.80 hrs.	100.00
06/09/2009	WT	Preparation of correspondence to S. Mitchell re: second copy of affidavit (.2); Prepare notice of appearance in Ziegler v. TCC (.3);	0.50 hrs.	20.00
06/09/2009	WRM	Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: employee grievance (.4) (3 calls; Dictation and preparation of correspondence to A. Maxwell (FCHR) re: FCHR complaint (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to S. Mathew re: DOAH matter (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.1); Review grievance policy re: employee grievance (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee grievance (.1); Telephone conference with S. Mitchell re: campus incident (.3); E-mail to E. Eunice re: campus incident (.1); Review and sign correspondence to S. Mitchell re: copy of report to TCCPD (.1);	1.70 hrs.	212.50
06/10/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (5) from S. Search re: College Success Workbook copyright (.2); E-mail to S. Search re: College	1.30 hrs.	162.50

Sucess Workbook copyright (.1); Review and sign notice of appearance in FCHR matter (.1); Telephone conference with E. Eunice re: campus incident (.1); Telephone conference with E. Eunice/W. Rabon re: campus incident (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.2);

06/11/2009	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: CCB Lease (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR response (.1); E-mail to J. Murdaugh re: FCHR response (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Telephone conference with A. Maxwell (FCHR) re: response to FCHR complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Preparation of response to FCHR complaint (1.8); E-mail to R. Tolson re: response to FCHR complaint (.1);</p>	2.60 hrs.	325.00
06/12/2009	WRM	<p>Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint response (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint responses (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from J. Murdaugh re: FCHR complaint response (.3); E-mails (3) to J. Murdaugh re: FCHR complaint response (.3); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues (.1); Review and analysis of PSAH Lease (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: PSAH Lease (.1); Telephone conferences with (3) J. Murdaugh re: FCHR complaint response (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: PSAH lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from N. Sneed re: FCHR complaint response (.1); Review, revise response to FCHR complaint, review revise affidavits in support of response (1.8); Begin review and analysis of</p>	4.20 hrs.	525.00

documentation re: employee action (.7);

06/15/2009	WT	Telephone conference with C. Schmidt re: records on petitioner in DOAH matter;	0.20 hrs.	8.00
06/15/2009	WT	Telephone conference with S. Mathew's office re: moving deposition of petitioner in DOAH matter;	0.20 hrs.	8.00
06/16/2009	WT	Prepare notice of filing notarized affidavit of James Murdaugh in new FCHR matter (.2); Preparation of correspondence to A. Maxwell re: notarized affidavit (.2); Prepare notice of taking deposition of petitioner in DOAH matter (.2);	0.60 hrs.	24.00
06/17/2009	WT	Prepare notice of deposition of Schmidt in DOAH matter;	0.30 hrs.	12.00
06/17/2009	WRM	E-mail to T. Smith re: scholarship funding (.10; Review and analysis of TCC CROP scholarship agreement (.8); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Smith re: DOAH matter (.2); E-mail to S. Search on DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to S. Johnson re: analysis of CROP scholarship agreement (.3); Telephone conference with P. Manning re: public records exemption (.1); Receipt and review of BMO invoice for May, 2009 (.1); Telephone conferences with T. Smith re: BMO invoice, public records (2 calls) (.3); Telephone conference with S. Balog re: public record exemption (.2); Telephone conference with S. Mathew re: DOAH matter (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: manufacturing center (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Murdaugh re: dangerous activity release (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from P. Manning re: public records exceptions (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: scholarship funding (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Jefferson re: student athlete (.2); E-mails (2) to V. Mayes re: DOAH matter deposition (.2);	5.20 hrs.	650.00

Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Mayes re: DOAH matter deposition (.1); Review and sign notice of deposition of petitioner in DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Review and sign notice of deposition of expert in DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with B. Law re: manufacturing center (.1); Telephone conference with B. Spiers re: restricted scholarship (.1); Telephone conferences with T. Smith re: restricted scholarship (2 calls) (.3); E-mail to J. Murdaugh re: dangerous activity release (.1); Analysis of dangerous entity release (.2); Receipt and review of proposed letter re: student athlete (.2); E-mail to S. Jefferson re: student athlete letter (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: scholarship contract agreement (.1);

06/18/2009	WRM	<p>E-mail to S. Mathew re: proposed confidentiality order in DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: information request in DOAH matter, employee off-campus incident (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: witnesses in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail V. Mayes re: DOAH matter meeting (.1); Begin preparation for first round of depositions in DOAH matter (2.4); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: FCCAA contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: DOAH matter deposition (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: DOAH matter depositions (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: employee incident (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Search re: DOAH matter depositions (.2); E-mail to S. Search re: DOAH matter depositions (.1); Complete review of documents in support of employee action (.3); E-mail to R. Tolson re: documents supporting employee action (.1); Receipt and review of documents re: employee off-campus</p>	7.40 hrs.	925.00
------------	-----	--	-----------	--------

incident (.3); Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: employee incident, actions (2 calls) (.3); Analysis: response to off-campus employee incident (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: EEOC filing by ex-employee (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to R. Tolson re: off-campus employee incident (.3); Telephone conferences with M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (2 calls) (.2); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: EEOC filing (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: transfer of EEOC matter to FCHR (.1); Review and analysis of FCCAA 2009-10 contract (.3); E-mail to T. Smith re: FCCAA contract (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: information report - DOAH matter (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from S. Mathew, with deposition notice and proposed confidentiality order in DOAH matter (.3); E-mail to V. Mayes re: her deposition in DOAH matter (.1);

06/19/2009	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: witness in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: witness in DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with B. Sloan re: witnesses, theories in DOAH matter (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee off campus incident (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee off campus incident, witnesses/issues in DOAH matter (.2); Conference with V. Mayes re: preparation for deposition in DOAH matter (3.5); Review TCC Board Agenda for June 22, 2009 (.8); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: witness information in DOAH matter (.1); Continued preparation for deposition in DOAH matter (2.3);</p>	7.40 hrs.	925.00
06/20/2009	BJL	<p>Review and analysis of petitioner's impairment for DOAH matter;</p>	3.00 hrs.	375.00

06/22/2009	WT	Telephone conference with Dr. Schmidt's office re: records (.2); Preparation of correspondence to Dr. Schmidt's office re: stipulation for confidentiality in DOAH matter (.2);	0.40 hrs.	16.00
06/22/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of impairment in DOAH matter (1.0); Prepare memo on impairment in DOAH matter (1.5);	2.50 hrs.	312.50
06/22/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: witnesses in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Balog re: Perkins documentation with attached notes (.2); Review Perkins meeting notes (.1); Telephone conference with G. Smith re: DOAH matter information (.1); Telephone conferences with C. Call re: DOAH matter information (.3); E-mail to P. Manning/S. Balog re: Perkins documentation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from P. Manning re: Perkins documentation (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mails (2) from S. Mathew re: deposition of petitioner in DOAH matter (.2); E-mail to S. Mathew re: deposition of petitioners in DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with B. Law re: development question (.2); Analysis of development question (.2); Telephone conferences with T. Snow re: DOAH matter (2 calls) (.2); Attend TCC Board Meeting (2.0); Conference with B. Law, R. Tolson re: employee issue, DROP, industrial development training (.8); Continued preparation for deposition in DOAH matter (4.6);	9.30 hrs.	1,162.50
06/23/2009	BJL	Review and analysis of disorder for DOAH matter;	0.10 hrs.	12.50
06/23/2009	WRM	Attend deposition of TCC staff members in DOAH matter (6.0); Conferences (3) with S. Mathew, S. Search, V. Mayes re: DOAH matter (2.5); Conference with R. Tolson re:	9.70 hrs.	1,212.50

various human resources issues (1.0);
Telephone conferences with J. Garrity re:
FCHR matter (2 calls) (.2);

06/23/2009	WRM	Telephone conference with G. Smith re: DOAH matter (.2); E-mails (2) to S. Mathew re: DOAH matter witnesses (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Ghazvini lease, vendor lease, employee issues (.2); Telephone conference with J. Garrity re: employee action - EEOC (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Ghazvini lease (.1); E-mail to M. Haney re: Ghazvini lease approval (.1); Telephone conference with T. Snow re: DOAH matter information (.2); Continued preparation for deposition of expert in DOAH matter (4.3); E-mail to B. Sloan re: DOAH matter witnesses (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from B. Sloan re: DOAH matter witnesses (.3); Attend deposition of expert C. Schmidt in DOAH matter (continued) (1.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: expert deposition in DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: DOAH matter records (.1); Receipt and review of 2009-2014 City of Tallahassee StarMetro Agreement (.4); Telephone conference with S. Mathew re: documents in DOAH matter (.2); Telephone conference with C. McNally re: DOAH matter (.1);	7.90 hrs.	987.50
06/24/2009	WT	Review Schmidt's file on petitioner in DOAH matter;	0.80 hrs.	32.00
06/25/2009	WT	Telephone conference with S. Matthew re: rescheduling J. Gibby deposition (.3); Prepare amended notice of taking deposition of J. Gibby (.2);	0.50 hrs.	20.00
06/25/2009	WRM	E-mail to S. Mathew re: documents in DOAH matter (.1); E-mails (3) to J. Garrity re: FCHR matter (.3); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from S. Mitchell re: campus incident (.2); E-mail to E. Eunice re: campus	9.00 hrs.	1,125.00

incident (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re; WTLH agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: StarMetro contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) R. Tolson re: FCHR matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: FCHR complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from E. Eunice re: campus incident (.1); E-mails (2) to V. Mayes re: DOAH matter witnesses (.2); E-mail to M. Haney re: insurance provision in Ghazvini Lease (.1); Telephone conference with C. McNally re: DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conference with J. Garrity re: FCHR complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Mayes re: DOAH matter witnesses (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail to S. Mathew re: DOAH matter documents (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Garrity re: FCHR complaint (.2); E-mail to C. Call re: DOAH matter (.1); Preparation for interview today with DOAH matter witnesses (.5); E-mail to B. Sloan re: DOAH matter witness (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: FCHR matter (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan, others re: DOAH matter petitioner deposition (.1); Conference with C. McNally re: DOAH matter (1.5); Review Volumes One and Two of petitioner's exhibits in DOAH matter (2.5); Conference with G. Smith, R. Abert re: DOAH matter (1.3); Conference with R. Tolson re: DOAH and FCHR matters (.5);

06/26/2009	WT	Telephone conference with Tallahassee Memorial Regional Medical Center Behavioral Health re: records on petitioner in DOAH matter, authorization (.2); Telephone conference with B. Sloan's office re: deposition of B. Sloan (.2);	0.40 hrs.	16.00
06/26/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: DOAH matter deposition (.1); Receipt,	7.40 hrs.	925.00

review and analysis of correspondence from R. Johnston re: audit response letter (.1); Preparation for petitioner's deposition in DOAH matter (3.9); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.4); Review and sign amended notice of deposition of petitioner in DOAH matter (.1); Telephone conferences with C. Call re: DOAH matter (2 calls) (.2); Telephone conferences with B. Lesko re: DOAH matter (2 calls) (.2); Analysis of WTLH premises use agreement (.6); E-mail to J. Schilling re: WTLH agreement (.2); Review additional documents produced by petitioner re: DOAH matter (.3); E-mails (2) to S. Mathew re: additional documents in DOAH matter (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan, others re: petitioner's deposition, DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Haney re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: Ghazvini Lease insurance (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Mathew re: documents in DOAH matter (.3); E-mail to B. Sloan re: DOAH matter deposition, documents (.1); E-mail to S. Search re: DOAH matter deposition (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Mayes re: petitioner's deposition in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to V. Mayes re: petitioner's deposition in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to S. Mathew re: DOAH petitioner e-mails (.1);

06/29/2009	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mails from S. Mathew re: witness depositions in DOAH matter, witnesses, documents (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Mathew re; issues list in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Maxwell re: WTLH agreement (.1); E-mail to A. Maxwell re: WTLH agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Sloan re: Tal Eval agreement (.3); E-mail to B. Sloan re: Tal Eval agreement (.1); E-mails (4) to J. Mayes re: employee	9.40 hrs.	1,175.00
------------	-----	--	-----------	----------

deposition in DOAH matter (.4); Conference with B. Sloan re: DOAH matter (.5); Conference with C. Call/J. Powell re: DOAH matter (1.0); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from V. Mayes re: employee deposition in DOAH matter, witnesses (.4); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from S. Hall re: WTLH agreement (.3); E-mail to S. Hall re: WTLH agreement (.1); E-mail to S. Mathew re: DOAH matter deposition (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: DOAH matter witness (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: DOAH matter process (.1); E-mail to C. Call re: deposition in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: deposition in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: evaluations in DOAH matter (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan/others re: petitioner's witness list in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Call re: deposition in DOAH matter (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Schilling re: WTLH agreement (.2); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: WTLH agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Sloan re: MESA contract (.2); Receipt and review of indemnity provision in MESA contract (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: MESA contract indemnity provisions (.1); Preparation for deposition of petitioner re: DOAH matter (4.0);

06/30/2009	WRM	Attend deposition of petitioner re: DOAH matter;	7.00 hrs.	875.00
			Fees for this matter	\$17,142.00

DISBURSEMENTS

06/01/2009	Copy charges - 712 copies at .10 per copy	71.20
06/02/2009	Copy charges - 8 copies at .10 per copy	0.80
06/03/2009	Copy charges - 452 copies at .10 per copy	45.20
06/08/2009	Other fee - sending CCLA documents to Gloria Wells	1.05
06/12/2009	Copy charges - 394 copies at .10 per copy	39.40
06/12/2009	Other fee - sending response to Tolson and Murdaugh	9.90
06/17/2009	Copy charges - 15 copies at .10 per copy	1.50

Jerry Schilling

Invoice# 8499

Page 17

06/22/2009	Copy charges - 12 copies at .10 per copy	1.20
06/23/2009	Copy charges - 32 copies at .10 per copy	3.20
06/25/2009	Copy charges - 27 copies at .10 per copy	2.70
06/26/2009	Outside copies of records produced after deposition - Casey Schmidt, Ph.D. - Clinical Pyschologist	72.50
06/26/2009	Court Reporting & Transcripts Fee - appearance fee for deposition of Dr. Casey Schmidt (deposition continued) - Wilkinson & Associates;	65.00

Disbursements for this matter \$313.65

BILLING SUMMARY

Longfellow, B. Joe	Associate	12.80 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$1,600.00
Mabile, William R	Attorney	121.20 hrs	125.00 /hr	\$15,150.00
Twilley, Winifred	Paralegal	9.80 hrs	40.00 /hr	\$392.00

Fees 143.80 hrs \$17,142.00

Disbursements \$313.65

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

\$17,455.65

Fees Billed Fiscal Year to Date 117,867.50

Expenses Billed Fiscal Year to Date 607.50

Fees Received Fiscal Year to Date 100,725.50

Expenses Received Fiscal Year to Date 293.85