




March 18, 2013

MEMORANDUM

TO: District Board of Trustees
FROM: Jim Murdaugh, President 
SUBJECT: Attorney Invoice - Andrews, Crabtree, Knox & Andrews, LLP
February 28, 2013

Item Description

Request for approval to pay the Board's attorney.

Overview and Background

On a monthly basis, the Board's attorney submits an invoice for services provided.

Past Actions by the Board

The Board of Trustees approved the contract at the October 18, 2010 Board meeting and shall be effective through October 31, 2011. The contract may be renewed on an annual basis with four (4) consecutive one (1) year renewals for a total contract period of five (5) years. The Board approved year three (3) of the contract at the September 17, 2012 Board meeting which shall be effective until October 2013. The Board shall be billed on an annual flat fee of \$160,000 for services of the firm.

Funding/Financial Implications

Funding is budgeted in Fund 1, the Current Unrestricted Fund. The current amount due is \$13,508.33

Staff Resource

Teresa Smith

Recommended Action

Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

ANDREWS, CRABTREE, KNOX & ANDREWS, LLP

1558 VILLAGE SQUARE BLVD.

SUITE 1

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32309

TAX ID #59-3621660

February 28, 2013

Teresa Smith
Vice President for Administrative Services and
Chief Financial Officer
Tallahassee Community College
444 Appleyard Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32304

Invoice# 11246 WRM
Our file# T00007 02276
Billing through 02/27/2013

Tallahassee Community College (General)
P.O. Number: 2011 00001580

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/29/2013	WRM	Conference with T. Smith, R. Tolson re: employee issues (.5); Review records re: employee issues (.3); Conference with M. Murdaugh, T. Smith, R. Tolson re: employee issues (1.1); Conference with R. Tolson, review record re: employee issues (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes on development plan (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: sick leave (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) to R. Tolson re: employee issues (.3); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (5) from T. Smith re: employee issues (.5); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to J. Murdaugh re: employee issues (.3); Analysis: employee terminal sick leave (.6); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee terminal sick leave (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: employee issues (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Ingerman re: employee issues (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: employee issues (.3); Telephone conference with D. Wildes re: development plan (.1); Continued legal analysis re: employee issues (1.8);	8.90 hrs.
------------	-----	---	-----------

Conference with T. Smith re: B. Ingerman, D. Hendry re: employee issues (1.0); Conference with R. Tolson, J. Chaires-Lacey re: employee issues (.8);

01/30/2013	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Sloan re: policy and SACS review (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee issues (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: contract employee (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: policy and SACS review (.1); Telephone conference (2) with R. Tolson re: public safety officer (.2); Review document re: employee issues (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: policy and SACS review (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: policy and SACS review (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with D. Hendry re: public safety officer (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee issues documents (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Tolson re: terminal sick leave payout (.3); E-mails (2) to R. Tolson re: terminal sick leave payment (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: employee issues document (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee issues document (.1); E-mail to J. Murdaugh re: employee issues document (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: campus incident (.2); Telephone conferences (3) with T. Smith re: employee issues (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee issues (.1); Analysis - intellectual property policies for SACS review (1.8); E-mails (2) to B. Sloan re: intellectual property policies for SACS review (.4); Analysis: application of COT development plan (2.1);</p>	7.60 hrs.
01/31/2013	WT	<p>Review plaintiff's response to request for production re: incident reports (Network v. TCC) (.4); Preparation of correspondence to S. Fisher re: documents missing from pre-trial catalog (Network v. TCC) (.3);</p>	0.70 hrs.

01/31/2013	WRM	Telephone conference with L. Powell re: employee issues (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Ingerman re: computer use (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee issues (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: SACS review, policies (.1); Telephone conferences (3) with R. Tolson re: employee issues (.3); Review TCC policies re: employee issues (.3); Review and sign correspondence to S. Fisher re: Network's exhibits in Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee issues (.1); Review, revise letter to employee re: employee issues (.1); E-mail to D. Wildes re: COT Development Agreement (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: terminal sick leave pay (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues/terminal sick leave pay (.1); Telephone conferences (3) with D. Wildes re: COT Development Agreement (.3); Analysis: application of COT Development authority to College (2.7); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: contract employee FMLA (.2); Conference with R. Tolson re: terminal sick leave pay (.5); Conference with T. Smith re: employee issue, review documentation (1.2);	6.60 hrs.
02/01/2013	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from A. DeFoor re: audit questions (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes re: development agreement information (.1); Continued analysis: accumulated sick leave pay upon termination(1.5); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: accumulated sick leave pay (.2); Continued summary judgment hearing and trial preparation re: Network v. TCCF (3.0); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee issues (.3);	5.20 hrs.
02/04/2013	WRM	Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee issues, terminal sick leave payout	1.00 hrs.

		(.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee issues (.1); Continued preparation for summary judgment hearing and trial in Network v. TCCF (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from TCC Communications re: Leadership Conference (.1);	
02/05/2013	WRM	Telephone conferences (4) with J. Chaires-Lacey re: FMLA contact (.4); Analysis - new caselaw re: plaintiff's theory in Network v. TCCF (.3); Analysis - FMLA leave - TCC's right to additional information (1.6); Review and analysis of new caselaw re: Sunshine Law (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chaires-Lacey re: FMLA information (.1); E-mail to J. Chaires-Lacey re: FMLA information (.1); Telephone conference with L. Powell re: FMLA information (.1); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF - Trial (.1); Telephone conference with D. Wildes re: development plan - COT (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF trial (.1);	3.30 hrs.
02/06/2013	WT	Begin preparing file for trial (.6); Preparation of correspondence to Judge Cooper re: motion for summary judgment hearing (.2); Network v. TCC	0.80 hrs.
02/06/2013	WRM	E-mails (2) to M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: employee issues (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from B. Ingerman re: employee issues (.4); E-mails (3) to B. Ingerman, others re: employee issues (.3); E-mail to S. Search re: employee issues (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: employee issues (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee issues (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF (.1); Telephone conferences (2) from J. Sauls re: Network v. TCCF (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from S.	5.60 hrs.

Search re: official communications (.4);
 E-mails (2) to S. Search re: official
 communications (.2); Receipt and review of
 e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: employee issues
 (.2); Continued preparation for summary
 judgment hearing and trial in Network v.
 TCCF (2.4); Review and sign correspondence
 to Judge J. Cooper re: hearing on summary
 judgment motion in Network v. TCCF (.1);
 Receipt and review of e-mail from B.
 Ingerman re: service agreement (.1); Receipt
 and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: service
 agreement (.1); E-mail to B. Ingerman re:
 service agreement (.1);

02/07/2013	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: technology for retirees (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: student issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from M. Edwards re: student issue (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Barber re: Network v. TCCF hearing (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: student issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Ingerman re: technology for retirees (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee issue, technology for retirees (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Miller re: clinical affiliation agreement (.1); E-mail to M. Edwards re: student issue (.1); E-mail to S. Search re: student issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: student issue (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: student issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: technology for retirees (.1); Conference with R. Tolson, M. Edwards re: student issues (1.0); Conference with T. Smith, R. Tolson re: employee issues, terminal sick leave pay (1.0); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: student issue (.1); Background research re: student issues (.4); Review and analysis of TCC Dental Training Program agreement with DOC (.3); Review</p>	8.70 hrs.
------------	-----	---	-----------

and sign notice of deposition of J. Sauls in Network v. TCCF (.1); Continued trial/hearing preparation in Network v. TCCF (3.8);

02/08/2013	WT	Prepare notice of taking trial deposition of James Sauls;	0.20 hrs.
02/08/2013	WT	Telephone conference with J. Sauls re: pre-deposition meeting with Bill Mabile for 2/13/13 (.2) (Network); Review Tallahassee Democrat re: TCC women's basketball coach/interim coach (.2);	0.40 hrs.
02/08/2013	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Tolson re: employee issues (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Edwards re: student issues (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails from T. Smith re: proposed contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: employee issues (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chaires-Lacey re: employee issues (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from C. Brown re: employee issues (.1); E-mails (2) to M. Edwards re: student issues (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues (.2); E-mail to J. Murdaugh re: employee issues (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee performance (.3); E-mails (2) to R. Tolson re: employee issues (.2); Review TCC policies - code of conduct/discipline (.7); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re; employee issues (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re; employee issues (.1); Telephone conference with L. Powell re: employee issues (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee issues meeting (.1); Telephone conference with J. Murdaugh re: employee issues (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: employee issues (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: student issue (.1); Continued preparation for motion hearing in Network v. TCCF (1.0); Conference with R. Tolson/J. Steele re: employee	7.00 hrs.

performance (1.0); Conference with T. Smith/R. Tolson re: employee issues, terminal sick leave pay (1.5);

02/10/2013	WRM	Receipt and review of news article re: women's basketball (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee issues documentation (.1); E-mail to T. Smith, R. Tolson re: employee leave (.1); Review and analysis of documentation re: employee issues (2.6);	2.90 hrs.
02/11/2013	BJL	Prepare for motion for summary judgment hearing;	0.90 hrs.
02/11/2013	WRM	E-mails (3) to T. Smith/R. Tolson re: employee issues, response (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: response to employee issues (.2); E-mail to S. Search re: response to employee issues (.1); Receipt and review e-mail from of G. Haile re: e-mail limitations (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) to B. Babb re: e-mail limitations (.2); Analysis - employee issues, appropriate responses (1.8); Review and analysis of Ikon contract and related documents (.8); E-mail to T. Smith re: Ikon contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Ikon contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: response to employee issues (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Gardner re: e-mail limitations (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues meeting (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee issues meeting (.1); Continued preparation for summary judgment hearing and trial in Network v. TCCF (4.2);	8.30 hrs.
02/12/2013	BJL	Prepare outline of argument and facts of motion for summary judgment hearing (1.1); Attend hearing on motion for summary judgment (1.8);	2.90 hrs.

02/12/2013	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Johnston re: hearing in Network v. TCCF (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Dominguez re: access to college grounds (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Gillian re: college e-mail use (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Crosby re: student registration (.1); E-mail to S. Crosby re: student registration (.1); E-mail to R. Johnston re: hearing in Network v. TCCF (.1); E-mail to T. Smith/R. Tolson re: employee issue response (.1); Receipt and review of Network's motion to strike witness deposition in Network v. TCCF (.2); Telephone conference with J. Sauls re: deposition in Network v. TCCF (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: several employee issues (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: employee issues resolution (.3); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: employee issues resolution (.2); Revise employee issue resolution document (.4); E-mail to M. Edwards re: student issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Edwards re: student issue (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: student issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee issues resolution (.1); Review draft employee issue resolution document (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee issues resolution documents (.1); Final preparation for Network v. TCCF hearing on summary judgment motion (3.9); Preparation for meetings (2) on 2/13/13 re: employee and student issues (.5); Attend hearing on TCCF motion for summary judgment with Judge J. Cooper (.9);</p>	8.40 hrs.
02/13/2013	WT	<p>Preparation of correspondence to S. Fisher re: order on plaintiff's emergency motion (Network v. TCC);</p>	0.20 hrs.
02/13/2013	WRM	<p>Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee issues responses (.3); E-mail to R. Johnston re: Network v. TCCF (.1); E-mail to</p>	10.10 hrs.

R. Tolson re: employee action (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Tolson re: employee issues/actions (.3); Conference with R. Tolson, J. Steele re: employee action, document review (.7); Conference with R. Tolson, document review re: employee issues, actions, resolution (1.4); Conference with M. Edwards, DOC IG investigator re: DOC employee issues (.6); Conference with S. Search, R. Tolson re: employee issues/action, student issues (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Pankowski re: Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee recommended action (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to C. Brown re: employee contract and HR file (.2); Preparation for conference with J. Sauls re: Network v. TCCF (.7); Preparation for conference with M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF (.8); Dictation and preparation of draft order denying Network's motion for protective order in Network v. TCCF (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: employee actions (.1); E-mail to S. Search re: employee actions (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee actions (.1); Continued preparation for trial in Network v. TCCF (1.1); Telephone conference with L. Powell re: employee action (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee action (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: Employee action (.1); E-mail to L. Kling re: employee action (.1); Conference with J. Sauls re: preparation for his deposition in Network v. TCCF (1.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Brynes re: aggression training (.1); E-mail to D. Hendry re: aggression training (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Hendry re: aggression training (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: student complaints (.2); Receipt and

review of e-mail from T. Smith re: student complaint (.1); E-mail to T. Smith, R. Tolson re: student complaints (.1);

02/14/2013	WT	Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from S. Fisher re: proposed changes to order (.1); Revise order based on S. Fisher proposal (.1); Preparation of correspondence to S. Fisher re: revised order (.2); Telephone conference with J. Sauls re: payments made to Network between September 2006 and January 2007 (.2); Review information on Karl Edge to locate (.3); Preparation of correspondence to Judge Cooper re: proposed order (.2); (all re: Network v. TCCF)	1.10 hrs.
02/14/2013	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: employee absence (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: employee absence (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee FMLA documents (.1); Conference with M. Turnbull re: preparation for trial in Network v. TCCF (1.8); Review revised proposed order in Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: TCC property with former employee (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: student issues (.2); Continued preparation for trial in Network v. TCCF (2.0); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: former employee, TCC property (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: former employee, TCC property (.1); Telephone conferences with R. Tolson (2) re: student issues (.2); Telephone conference with K. Edge re: Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from P. Locascio re: indemnity clause (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Fisher re: deposition in Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: employee absence (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Mallowney re: Government in Sunshine (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Chase re: Government in Sunshine (.1); Receipt and	6.30 hrs.

		review of e-mails (2) from C. Dominguez re: Government in Sunshine (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Miller re: Government in Sunshine (.1); Outline plan for review of student complaints (.5);	
02/15/2013	WT	Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from S. Fisher re: additional documents from deposition; (re: Network v. TCCF);	0.20 hrs.
02/15/2013	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Miller re: Government in Sunshine (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: TCC property in possession of former employee (.3); E-mail to T. Smith re: former employee in possession of TCC property (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: final pay check for former employee (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to C. Brown re: return of TCC property (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: final pay check for former employee (.2); Attend deposition of J. Sauls (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail re: S. Fisher re: documents in Network v. TCCF (.1); E-mail to S. Fisher re: Network v. TCCF documents (.1); Continued preparation for trial in Network v. TCCF (1.5); Conference with S. Search/R. Tolson re: student issues (.9); Conference with R. Chaney re: student issues (1.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Barber re: Network v. TCCF (.1); Review documents from S. Fisher re: Network v. TCCF (.2); E-mail to S. Search/R. Tolson re: student issues interview (.2); Receipt and review of Board Business meeting agenda for February 18, 2013 (.5);	6.80 hrs.
02/18/2013	WT	Review deposition of James Sauls; (Network v. TCCF)	0.40 hrs.
02/18/2013	WRM	Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee issue resolution, absent employee (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from D.	8.90 hrs.

Hendry re: public speakers (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from P. Manning re: audit request (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: audit request (.1); E-mails (2) to P. Manning re: audit request (.2); E-mails (2) to M. Edwards re: student complaints (.2); E-mails (2) to S. Search/R. Tolson re: student complaints (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Search re: student complaints (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails from M. Edwards re: student complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: student complaints (.1); E-mail to S. Search, others re: student issues (.1); Telephone conference with M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF (.1); E-mail to L. Kling, D. Wildes re: audit request (.1); Telephone conference with C. Brown re: terminated employee (.1); E-mail to S. Search, others re: terminated employee (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: terminated employee (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Ingerman re: return of TCC property (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Grow re: deposition in Network v. TCCF (.1); Continued preparation - legal for Network v. TCCF trial (3.4); Attend TCC Board Workshop and Business Meeting (2.8);

02/19/2013	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from S. Search re: student complaints (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Ingerman re: return of TCC property (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail (2) from R. Chaney re: student complaints (.2); E-mail to S. Search re: student complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Kling re: notice of meeting (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from R. Chaney re: student complaints, follow-up (.4); E-mail to R. Chaney re: student complaints (.1); E-mail to D. Wildes re: meeting notice (.1); E-mail to L. Kling re: meeting notice (.1); Review and analysis of new case re: mutual</p>	7.60 hrs.
------------	-----	--	-----------

mistake - contract for use in Network v. TCCF (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF (.2); Telephone conference with D. Wildes re: COT development agreement, meeting motion, architect contract (.2); E-mail to P. Manning re: meeting notice (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Ingerman re: GSMU Software agreement (.1); Telephone conference with L. Powell re: student complaints (.1); Review and analysis of GSMU software agreement (1.3); E-mail to B. Ingerman re: GSMU software agreement (.2); Dictation and preparation of Fact portion of Trial Brief in Network v. TCCF (.9); Continued trial preparation in Network v. TCCF (2.8);

02/20/2013	WT	Prepare notice of filing affidavit of W. Mabile (.2); Prepare notice of filing deposition of James Sauls (.2); (both for Network v. TCCF)	0.40 hrs.
02/20/2013	WRM	E-mails (3) to R. Chaney re: student complaint interviews (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: technology offer (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: technology offer (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from R. Chaney re: student complaint interviews (.4); Preparation for meeting on COT comprehensive plan (.5); Review and sign notices of filing of documents in Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: COBRA enrollment, former employee (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: former employee pay (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: former employee paycheck deductions (.3); Receipt and review of order on summary judgment motion in Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of order on Network's motion for protective order (.1); E-mail to R. Johnston, others re: ruling in Network v. TCCF (.1); Review interview schedule re: student complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Pankowski re: ruling in Network v. TCCF (.1); Conference	8.40 hrs.

		with D. Wildes re: COT Development Plan Co-ordinator (1.5); Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: trial in Network v. TCCF (.1); E-mails (2) to D. Hendry re: computer use (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Hendry re: computer use (.1); Continued preparation for trial in Network v. TCCF (4.0);	
02/21/2013	BJL	Prepare direct examination of Marjorie Turnbull for trial (2.1); Conference re: direct examination of Marjorie Turnbull for trial (.4);	2.50 hrs.
02/21/2013	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF (.1); Telephone conference with L. Kling re: gift to college employees (.1); Telephone conference with C. Brown re: former employee (.1); Review and analysis of gift reporting per Florida Commission on Ethics (.3); E-mail to L. Kling re: gift to College employees (.1); E-mails (2) to J. Murdaugh re: former employee (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: former employee (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: Four Points by Sheraton Rate Agreement (.1); Review and analysis of Four Points by Sheraton Rate Agreement (.2); E-mail to G. Wells re: Four Points by Sheraton Rate Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Miller re: domestic partnership (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re; final paycheck for former employee (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Kling re: gift to college employee (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: former employee, paycheck, reimbursement (.4); E-mails (2) to R. Johnston re: Network v. TCCF (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: Network v. TCCF (.1); Continued trial preparation Network v. TCCF (5.7);	8.00 hrs.
02/22/2013	BJL	Review and analysis of trial brief to court (.3); Conference with Marjorie Turnbull to prepare	3.80 hrs.

for trial testimony (2.2); Review and analysis of certified copy of quitclaim deed and contribution/assumption agreement (.7); Revise and edit direct examination questions for Marjorie Turnbull (.6);

02/22/2013	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: employee issue resolution (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from S. Search re: employee issue resolution (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Murdaugh re: employee issue resolution (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Turnbull re: trial preparation meeting in Network v. TCCF (.2); E-mail to J. Murdaugh, others re: employee issue resolution (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Babb re: domestic partnerships (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: domestic partnerships (.1); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: trial preparation meeting (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with C. Brown re: employee issue resolution (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Dominquez re: domestic partnership (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Miller re: domestic partnership (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from P. Locascio re: domestic partnership (.1); Conference with M. Turnbull re: trial preparation for Network v. TCCF (1.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from Visa/MC Interchange Settlement (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: media inquiry (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: media inquiry (.4); Telephone conferences (2) with A. Maxwell re: media inquiry (.2); Review Interchange Settlement update information (.2); Continued trial preparation in Network v. TCCF (2.3); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: TCC audit/response letter (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from K. Revell re: TCC audit/response letter (.1);</p>	6.80 hrs.
02/23/2013	WRM	<p>Trial preparation - Network v. TCCF,</p>	2.80 hrs.

Date	Invoice#	Description	Hours
		cross-examination of J. Colon, closing, theme;	
02/24/2013	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee action response (.1); Trial preparation - Network v. TCCF, direct examination, opening, closing, cross-examination (2.0);	2.10 hrs.
02/25/2013	BJL	Attend trial (7.4); Review and analysis of case law supporting a directed verdict (.4); Prepare opening statement for trial (.7);	8.50 hrs.
02/25/2013	WRM	Attend trial in Network v. TCCF before Judge J. Cooper (7.4); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from D. Wildes re: IGT Financial review (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: Visa/MC Interchange (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: Visa/MC Interchange (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Search re: student complaints (.1); E-mail to S. Search re: student complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Florida College Risk Management consortium agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Visa/MC Interchange (.1); Telephone conference with A. Maxwell re: media injury (.1); E-mail to M. Pankowski re: Network v. TCCF trial (.1); Review and analysis of FCRMC agreement (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: FCRMC agreement (.1);	8.80 hrs.
02/26/2013	BJL	Attend court ruling and finding of facts for trial (Network v. TCC);	1.50 hrs.
02/26/2013	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: Network v. TCCF meeting (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: IGT financial review (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes re: IGT financial review (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from M. Pankowski re: Network v. TCCF trial (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Search re: student complaints (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: former	7.10 hrs.

employee pay deductions (.1); Review and analysis of IGT financial and lease documents (1.0); Telephone conferences (2) with C. Brown re: former employee issue resolution (.3); Review and analysis of former employee pay deductions (.1); Review and analysis of background information re: credit interchange settlement (.6); E-mail to T. Smith re: former employee pay deduction (.1); Review and analysis of audit letters from Auditor General (.2); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to K. Revell, Florida Auditor General's office re: TCC financial statement (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF (.2); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Chaney re: student complaints (.1); E-mail to R. Chaney re: student complaints (.1); Attend hearing with Judge J. Cooper re: Network v. TCCF (1.5); E-mail to M. Pankowski, others re: result in Network v. TCCF Trial (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes re: WEI architect selection (.1); Conference with T. Smith, B. Hinson, P. Manning re: credit card surcharge (.8); Conference with R. Tolson, J. Chaires-Lacey re: employee performance, former employee paycheck, student complaints (.6);

02/27/2013	WRM	Conduct interviews with staff and students re: student complaints (6.7); Telephone conferences (2) with D. Wildes re: Wakulla architect selection, campus lease (.3); Conference with D. Wildes re: campus lease, Wakulla architect selection (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Chaney re: student complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Powell re: student complaints (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Board meeting notice (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: former employee issues (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re:	8.50 hrs.
------------	-----	---	-----------

former employee issue (.1); Conference with
R. Tolson re: employee complaint resolution
(.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re:
employee complaint resolution (.2);

Flat Fees for this matter \$13,333.33

DISBURSEMENTS

02/21/2013 Court Reporting & Transcripts Fee - deposition of James Saul (Network v. TCC) - Wilkinson & Associates Court Reporters 131.00

02/26/2013 Copies of Quit Claim Deed and Contribution/Assumption Agreement for use at trial from Leon County Clerk of Circuit Court 44.00

Disbursements for this matter \$175.00

BILLING SUMMARY

Longfellow, B. Joe Associate 20.10 hrs

Mabile, William R Attorney 165.70 hrs

Taylor, Winifred Paralegal 4.40 hrs

Fees 190.20 hrs \$13,333.33

Disbursements \$175.00

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL \$13,508.33