




August 20, 2012

## MEMORANDUM

**TO:** District Board of Trustees

**FROM:** Jim Murdaugh, President 

**SUBJECT:** Attorney Invoice - Andrews, Crabtree, Knox & Andrews, LLP.  
July 2, 2012

---

### Item Description

Request for approval to pay the Board's attorney.

### Overview and Background

On a monthly basis, the Board's attorney submits an invoice for services provided.

### Past Actions by the Board

The Board of Trustees approved the contract at the October 18, 2010 Board meeting and shall be effective through October 31, 2011. The contract may be renewed on an annual basis with four (4) consecutive one (1) year renewals for a total contract period of five (5) years. The Board approved year two (2) of the contract at the September 19, 2011 Board meeting which shall be effective until October 2012. The Board shall be billed on an annual flat fee of \$160,000 for services of the firm.

### Funding/Financial Implications

Funding is budgeted in Fund 1, the Current Unrestricted Fund. The current amount due is \$13,333.33.

### Staff Resource

Teresa Smith

### Recommended Action

Authorize payment of invoice as presented.

ANDREWS, CRABTREE, KNOX & ANDREWS, LLP

P.O. BOX 12800  
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32317  
TAX ID #59-3621660

July 2, 2012

Jerry Schilling  
Assistant Vice President for Administrative Services  
Tallahassee Community College  
444 Appleyard Drive  
Tallahassee, FL 32304

Invoice# 10684 WRM  
Our file# T00007 02276  
Billing through 06/30/2012

Tallahassee Community College (General)  
P.O. Number: 2011 00001580

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 05/29/2012 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Network Security case (.1); Telephone conference with V. Montgomery re: employee issue (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Montgomery re: employee issue (.1); Telephone conference with M. Blakely re: former employee information (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: student project (.1); Telephone conferences (3) with J. Chaires-Lacy re: former employee information (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chaires-Lacy re: former employee information (.1); E-mail to R. Frazier re: student project (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee issue (.1); E-mail to M. Finkelstein re: student grade change (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Finkelstein re: student grade change (.1); | 1.40 hrs. |
| 05/30/2012 | JCK | Telephone conference with Teresa Smith re: contract for Florida Virtual Campus;  | 0.40 hrs. |
| 05/30/2012 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee action (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employees (2) actions (.2); Dictation and preparation of monthly Litigation Report for J. Murdaugh (.3); E-mails (4) to S. Jefferson re: student grade review  | 3.50 hrs. |

(.4); Telephone conferences (2) with F. Roberts re: student grade review (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Jefferson re: student grade review (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Easley re: Publix Pharmacy Tech Training agreement (.1); Review and analysis of Public Pharmacy Tech Training Agreement (.4); E-mail to C. Easley, re: Publix Pharmacy Tech Training Agreement (.1); Telephone conference with S. Jefferson re: student grade review (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Easley re: Publix Pharmacy Tech Training agreement (.1); Review and analysis of Publix Pharmacy Tech Training Agreement (.4); E-mail to C. Easley re: Publix Tech Training Agreement (.1); Telephone conference with S. Jefferson re; student grade review (.1); E-mail to F. Roberts re: student grade review (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from F. Roberts re: student grade review (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Hendry re: First Amendment Protected Events (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: President's evaluation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: FCSAA Athletic contract (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: FCSAA Athletic contract (.1);

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 05/31/2012 | JCK | <p>Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: FVC contract (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of initial proposed contract (.4); Receipt, review and analysis of revised contract from FVC (1.8); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Vanessa Lawrence re: Section 1006.73 (2)(d), Florida Statutes (.1); Review and analysis of Section 1006.73(2)(d), Florida Statutes (.4); Preparation of e-mail to Vanessa Lawrence re: Section 1006.73(2)(d), Florida Statutes (.2); Telephone conference with Teresa Smith re: FVC proposed contract provisions (.2); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from David Wildes re: easement at FPSI (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of</p> | 5.00 hrs. |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|

proposed easement from Bell South (.4); Telephone conference with David Wildes re: proposed easement restrictions (.3); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: conference call (.1); Preparation of e-mail to Teresa Smith re: conference call (.1); Attend conference call re: FVC contract revisions (.8);

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 06/01/2012 | JCK | <p>Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Vanessa Williams re: revised Release (.1); Review revised Release (.6); Prepare additional correction to revised release (.5); Preparation of e-mail to Teresa Smith re: suggested corrections to revised release (.3); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: revised release (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from David Wildes re; proposed contract with St. Leo College (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of proposed contract terms for TCC contract with St. Leo College (.2); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from David Wildes re: City sewer easement (.1); Review City sewer easement (.6); Telephone conference with David Wildes re; City sewer easement (.3); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from David Wildes re: proposed supplemental agreement for facilities lease (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of proposed supplemental lease agreement (.4); Revise supplemental lease agreement (.5); Receipt, review and analysis of lease agreement (.6); Preparation of e-mail to David Wildes (.2);</p> | 4.70 hrs. |
| 06/02/2012 | JCK | <p>Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: FVC's revised contract (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of "resolved" contract revisions and compare to TCC proposed revision (.9); Preparation of e-mail to Teresa Smith re: conference call availability (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: conference call availability (.1); Preparation of e-mail to</p>  | 1.30 hrs. |

|            |     |   |           |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|
|            |     | Teresa Smith re: conference call or meeting (.1);   |           |
| 06/04/2012 | JCK | Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: conference call procedure and her review of FVC contract with Jerry Schilling (.1); Attend conference call between TCC and DOE re: FVC contract revisions (.5); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Derrick Bennett re: revised contract (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: revised contract (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Vickki Sterling re: revised contract (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of revised contract (.4); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: revised contract (.1); Telephone conference with Teresa Smith re: contract revision review (.1); | 1.50 hrs. |
| 06/04/2012 | WT  | Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: status of case, plan moving forward (Network);  | 0.20 hrs. |
| 06/05/2012 | JCK | Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: FVC contract executed by FVC (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of partially executed contract (.4); Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Vanessa Williams re: contract changes (.1);   | 0.60 hrs. |
| 06/06/2012 | JCK | Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Teresa Smith re: amendment to actual cost provision of FVC contract;  | 0.10 hrs. |
| 06/08/2012 | JCK | Receipt, review and analysis of e-mail from Gloria Wells re: Brunet-Garcia contract (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of Sheet Form Agreement for photography services (.8); Preparation of e-mail to Gloria Wells re: approval of contract (.2);  | 1.10 hrs. |
| 06/08/2012 | WT  | Telephone conference with FSU re: payment of stormwater fees (.2); Telephone conference with FAMU re: payment of stormwater fees  | 0.40 hrs. |

(.2);

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 06/11/2012 | WT  | Telephone conference with FAMU re: stormwater fees;  | 0.10 hrs. |
| 06/13/2012 | WT  | Preparation of correspondence to J. Schilling re: L.C. claim (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from J. Schilling re: L.C. claim (.1);   | 0.20 hrs. |
| 06/14/2012 | WT  | Telephone conferences with L. C. to reschedule meeting;  | 0.20 hrs. |
| 06/15/2012 | WT  | Telephone conference with R. Green re: subpoena to appear on Monday (.1); Telephone conference with B. Newman re: subpoena for trial, subject matter (.2); Preparation of correspondence to R. Green re: expected questions at trial, documents (.2); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from R. Green re: trial testimony, will Bill Mabile attend with her (.1); Telephone conference with B. Newman re: Green was registrar on 8/31/09 (.1); Preparation of correspondence to R. Green re: Bill Mabile available to attend (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from R. Green with documents to be produced (.1); Preparation of correspondence to R. Green re: which documents to produce, provide contact information to L. Wiese (.2); | 1.10 hrs. |
| 06/15/2012 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from B. Spiers re: Title IV review resolution (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Hendry re: protection of vulnerable persons (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: FLVC (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Microsoft workshops (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Powell re: records subpoena(.1); E-mail to L. Powell re: records subpoena (.1); Telephone conference with R. Griever re: trial subpoenas (.1); Review trial subpoena, TCC employee   | 1.80 hrs. |

witness (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Leoni re: Network Security case (.1); E-mail to S. Leoni re: Network Security case (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes re: easement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from E. Auerbach re: Title IV review resolution (.3);

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 06/18/2012 | WRM | <p>Receipt and review of plaintiff's motion to set for trial in Network Security v. TCC (.1); Receipt and review of G. Lee Right-To-Sue Letter (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson, others re: G. Lee Right-To-sue Letter (.1); Review TCC Board Agenda for 6/18/12 (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Montgomery re: G. Lee Right-To-Sue letter (.1); E-mail to V. Montgomery re: G. Lee Right-To-Sue Letter (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: documents in Underwood v. TCC (.1); E-mail to A. Bryant re: documents in Underwood v. TCC (.1); E-mail to E. Ellison re: L.C. personal injury claim (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: documents in Underwood v. TCC (.1); Conference with T. Smith re: employee issue (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from L. Powell re: subpoena for records (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Frazier re: course copyright (.2); E-mail to R. Frazier re: course copyright (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: employee issue (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: proposal FLVC contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Title IV review appeal dismissal (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes re: FPSI easements (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: FLVC contract (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: FLVC contract (.1); E-mail to L. Powell re: subpoena for records (.1); Review and analysis of FLVC employment contract (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: employee issue (.1); Conference with T. Smith, others re: TCC/FLVC employee contract (.4);</p> | 6.10 hrs. |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
|            |     | Conference with J. Schilling re: supplement to windstorm contract (.3); Attend TCC Board workshop and business meeting (2.0);  |           |
| 06/19/2012 | WT  | Telephone conference with L. C. re: claims handler will contact re: claim;   | 0.10 hrs. |
| 06/19/2012 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes re: Sonitrol contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: TCC/FLVC employee contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from B. Ellison re: personal injury claim (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Hatfield re: personal injury claim (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: TCC/FLVS fiscal agent contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: course copyright (.1); E-mail to B. Hollimon re: course copyright (.1); Review and analysis of Sonitrol contract (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hollimon re: course copyright (.1); E-mail to D. Wildes re: Sonitrol contract (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with L. Green re: personal injury claim (.2); E-mails (2) to S. Rowland re: student enrollment (.2); Telephone conference with D. Waddell re: Starmetro contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Rowland re: student enrollment (.2); Telephone conference with F. Roberts re: student transcripts (.1); E-mails (2) to R. Green re: student transcripts (.2); Review and analysis of change in scope of services in existing contract (.6); Telephone conference with D. Wildes re: Sonitrol contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Green re: student transcripts (.1); | 3.50 hrs. |
| 06/20/2012 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Green re: student transcripts (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: student transcripts (.1); E-mail to R. Green re: student transcripts (.1); E-mail to F. Roberts re: student transcripts (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from D. Wildes re: TCC/FSU PC  | 3.80 hrs. |



lease (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from B. Sloan re: documents in Underwood v. TCC (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: TCC/FSU PC lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Roberts re: student transcripts (.1); Telephone conference with D. Waddell re: Star Metro contract (.1); Review and analysis of documents received from B. Sloan re: Underwood v. TCC (.6); E-mails (6) to A. Bryant re: Underwood v. TCC documents (.3); E-mail to B. Sloan re: Underwood v. TCC documents (.1); Review and analysis of TCC/FSU PC lease (.5); E-mail to D. Wildes re: TCC/FSU PC lease (.1); Telephone conference with D. Wildes re: security agreement (.1); Review and analysis of Microsoft Hosting Server Workshop Agreements (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: Microsoft Hosting Server Workshop Agreement (.1); E-mails (2) to G. Wells re: PSAV agreement (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from G. Wells re: PSA agreement (.2);

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 06/21/2012 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Bryant re: Underwood v. TCC (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from F. Brown re: Carnegie Foundation Agreement (.2); Review and analysis of Carnegie Foundation Data Sharing Agreement Addendum (.2); E-mail to F. Brown re: Carnegie Foundation Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from D. Wildes re: TCC/FSU PC lease (.2); E-mail to D. Wildes re: TCC/FSU PC lease (.1); Review and analysis of Ovid Technologies Online License Agreement (.5); E-mail to C. Thornburn re: Ovid agreement (.2); Telephone conference with D. Waddell re: Star Metro contract (.1); | 1.70 hrs. |
| 06/22/2012 | BJL | Review and analysis of FLSA and case law re: on-call requirements (.5); Review and analysis of case law re: competitive bidding statutes re: WMI contract (1.5);   | 2.00 hrs. |

|            |     |   |           |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|
| 06/22/2012 | WRM | Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee question and grievance (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from D. Wildes re: Vanguard Partnership (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Montgomery re: on-call pay (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Wildes (.1); Telephone conferences (4) with V. Montgomery re: on-call pay (.6); Review Chapter 83, Florida Statutes re: landlord's rights (.2); E-mail to D. Wildes re: Vanguard Partnership (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Jones re: on-call pay (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: employee questions, grievance, employees issues, contract (.3); E-mail to B. Jones re: on-call pay (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan, others re: OCR/Yale/Title IX (.1); Analysis: CCLA on-call pay (.9);                    | 3.00 hrs. |
| 06/25/2012 | BJL | Review and analysis of case law, contracts and accompanying documents re: Network Security agreement (2.2); Review and analysis Network Security contract language (.9);  | 3.10 hrs. |
| 06/25/2012 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from V. Montgomery re: CCLA on-call (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: windstorm mitigation contract (.1); Analysis: CCLA on-call policy and practice (.9); Dictation and preparation of memo re: V. Montgomery re: CCLA on-call policy and practice (.4); Analysis: windstorm mitigation contract proposed amendment (.4); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCF/TCCH case (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to S. Fisher re: case status (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith/J. Schilling re: windstorm mitigation contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Network v. TCCH/TCCN (.1); Analysis: employee indemnification in Network case (1.3); Dictation and preparation of memo to Board and overview and | 6.30 hrs. |

background for employee indemnification in Network case (.9); E-mail to R. Johnston re: employee indemnification in Network Security case (.2); Analysis: defenses in Network Security case (.6); Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: employee indemnification in Network Security case (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee grievance, employee FMLA (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Tolson re: employee grievance, employee FMLA (.3);

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 06/26/2012 | WT  | Telephone conference with Lewis, Longman & Walker re: Windstorm Mitigation contract;   | 0.10 hrs. |
| 06/26/2012 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Montgomery re: CCLA on-call (.1); E-mail to V. Montgomery re: CCLA on-call (.1); Review and analysis of background documents re: employee grievance (.3); Receipt and review of information re: employee absence, FMLA (.1); Telephone conference with V. Montgomery re: CCLA on-call (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee grievance, employee FMLA (.2); Analysis - Network Security case - agreement running with property (.4); Revise Board Agenda item re: employee indemnification (.3); E-mails (4) to J. Murdaugh re: Board agenda item - employee indemnification (.4); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Murdaugh re: Board agenda item - employee indemnification (.2); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: Board agenda item - employee indemnification (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Board agenda item employee indemnification (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee contract (.2); Analysis - CCLA exempt employees compensation (.9); E-mail to V. Montgomery re: CCLA exempt employees compensation (.1); | 3.70 hrs. |
| 06/27/2012 | WRM | Telephone conferences (5) from L. Killinger re: WMI contract (.7); Receipt and review of   | 7.70 hrs. |

e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: WMI contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: WMI contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from V. Montgomery re: exempt employees compensation (.1); Telephone conferences (4) with P. Mitchell re: former instructor complaint (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: WMI contract (.1); Telephone conference with B. Lesko re: former instructor complaint (.1); Telephone conferences (4) with S. Search re: former instructor complaint (.4); E-mail to R. Tolson re: former instructor complaint (.1); Review Windstorm Mitigation RFP, change in scope of contract (.6); E-mail to J. Schilling re: Windstorm Mitigation RFP (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from P. Mitchell re: former instructor complaint (.1); Telephone conference with F. Williams re: former instructor complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Sloan re: former instructor complaint (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: former instructor complaint (.1); Telephone conference with B. Sloan re: former instructor complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: amendment to FWC MOU (.1); Review amendment, previous amendment and FWC MOU (.4); E-mail to G. Wells re: amendment to FWC MOU (.1); Review FL Admin. Code re: WMI contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: WMI contract (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: WMI contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Wells Fargo contract (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith/J. Schilling re: WMI contract (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: former instructor complaint (.2); Telephone conference with L. Cone re: personal injury claim (.1); E-mail to R. Hatfield re: personal injury claim (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Hatfield re: personal injury claim (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Woodbury re: personal injury claim (.1);

Review windstorm mitigation statute (.3); Telephone conferences (2) from J. Schilling re: WMI contract (.3); Analysis of proposed amendment of WMI contract (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Woodbury re: personal injury claim (.1); Telephone conference with W. Rabon re: personal injury claim (.1); E-mails (2) to L. Woodbury re: personal injury claim (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from H. Bush re: amendment to FWC MOU (.3); E-mail to H. Bush re: amendment to FWC MOU (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: former instructor complaint (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: former instructor complaint (.1); Telephone conference with H. Bush re: FWC MOU amendment (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee performance (.1); Telephone conference with L. Powell re: employee performances (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee performance (.1);

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 06/28/2012 | WRM | <p>Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: employee indemnification (.1); E-mail to J. Murdaugh re: employee indemnification (.1); Telephone conferences (2) from J. Schilling re: WMI contract (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith, re: WMI contract, consultant report, employee issues (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: former instructor complaint (.1); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: employee indemnification (.1); Telephone conference with President's office (Martha) re: former instructor complaint (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: former instructor complaint (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: former instructor complaint (.1); E-mail to S. Search re: former instructor complaint (.1); Telephone conference with L. Killinger re: WMI contract (.1); Receipt and review of J. Schilling re: amendment to WMI contract (.1); Review amendment to WMI contract (.1);</p> | 1.80 hrs. |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|

E-mail to J. Schilling re: amendment to WMI contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: consultant contact (.1);

|            |     |  |           |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|
| 06/29/2012 | WRM | <p>Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: Underwood v. TCC with attachments (.2); E-mail to A. Bryant re: Underwood v. TCC (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: Underwood v. TCC (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnbull re: Network Security case (.1); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: consultant report (.1); E-mail to M. Turnbull re: Network Security case (.1); E-mail to R. Johnston re: Network Security case (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: consultant report (.2); E-mail to W. Rabon re: personal injury claim (.1); Telephone conference with W. Rabon re: personal injury claim (.1); E-mails (2) to L. Woodbury re: personal injury claim (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from L. Woodbury re: personal injury claim (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: consultant report (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: consultant report (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: consultant report (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee incident (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee complaint (.1); Review and analysis of consultant report, independent statutory review (3.1);</p> | 5.20 hrs. |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|

June Flat Fees for this matter      \$13,333.33

BILLING SUMMARY

|                    |           |           |
|--------------------|-----------|-----------|
| Knox, J. Craig     | Partner   | 14.70 hrs |
| Longfellow, B. Joe | Associate | 5.10 hrs  |
| Mabile, William R  | Attorney  | 49.50 hrs |
| Taylor, Winifred   | Paralegal | 2.40 hrs  |

Jerry Schilling

Invoice# 10684

Page 14

Fees

71.70 hrs

---

\$13,333.33

Disbursements

\$0.00

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

---

\$13,333.33