




May 16, 2011

MEMORANDUM

TO: District Board of Trustees
FROM: Jim Murdaugh, President 
SUBJECT: Attorney Invoice - Andrews, Crabtree, Knox & Andrews, LLP

Item Description:

Request for approval to pay the Board's attorney.

Overview:

On a monthly basis, the Board's attorney submits an invoice for services provided.

Salient Facts:

The College's attorney is hired by the Board under the authority of Section 1001.64(25), Florida Statutes, and for this reason invoices are brought for approval.

Past Actions:

The Board of Trustees approved the contract at the October 18, 2010 Board meeting and shall be effective through October 31, 2011. The contract may be renewed on an annual basis with four (4) consecutive one (1) year renewals for a total contract period of five (5) years. The Board shall be billed on an annual flat fee of \$160,000 for services of the firm.

Future Actions:

Monthly Invoices will be presented as they are submitted by the attorney.

Funding/Financial Matters:

Funding is budgeted in Fund 1, the Current Unrestricted Fund. The current amount due is \$13,333.33.

Staff Resource:

Teresa Smith

Recommended Action:

Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

ANDREWS, CRABTREE, KNOX & ANDREWS, LLP

P.O. BOX 12800
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32317
TAX ID #59-3621660

May 2, 2011

Jerry Schilling	Invoice#	9870	WRM
Assistant Vice President for Administrative Services	Our file#	T00007	02276
Tallahassee Community College	Billing through	04/30/2011	
444 Appleyard Drive			
Tallahassee, FL 32304			

Tallahassee Community College (General)
P.O. Number: 2011 00001580

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

04/01/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee issue (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee issue (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: Bookstore contract (.1); Preparation for FPSI student interviews re: former student complaint (.2); Receipt and review of documents from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.4); E-mail to J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Conduct interviews sith FPSI students re: former FPSI student complaint (5.9); Conference with T. Smith, R. Tolson re: employee issues, reorganization (1.4);	8.30 hrs.
04/03/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: insurance plan (.1); E-mail to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Dictation and preparation of TCC Litigation Report to J. Murdaugh (.3); E-mail to S. Heath re: CCLA Litigation (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Review records, documents re: former FPSI student complaint (.7);	1.60 hrs.
04/04/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from E. Eunice	3.00 hrs.

re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: Follett bookstore RFP response (.1); Begin preparation of report re: former FPSI student complaint (.7); Conference with E. Eunice re: former FPSI student complaint (.3); Telephone conference with B. Spiers re: former FPSI student complaint (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from G. Wells re: Follett Bookstore contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center Lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: allegation of improper on-line test taking (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from R. Bush re: M.E. whistleblower case (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of R. Bush re: M.U. lawsuits (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: former FPSI student complaint (.2); E-mail to J. Murdaugh re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Heath re: CCLA roof litigation (.1); Dictation and preparation of addition to Litigation report per S. Heath (.1); E-mail to S. Heath re: CCLA roof litigation (.1); Begin review/analysis of Follett bookstore proposal (.3);

04/05/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: June COBA meeting (.1); Review and analysis of Folett contract proposal (.9); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: two FPSI student complaints (.3); E-mails (3) to E. Eunice re: FPSI student complaint (.3); Telephone conferences (2) with D. Waddell re: two FPSI student complaints (.3); Conference with T. Smith, J. Schilling, M. Finkelstein, G. Sullivan re: Follett Bookstore contract (2.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Smith re: TCC/Flagler A.B. lawsuit (.1); E-mail to</p>	9.50 hrs.
------------	-----	--	-----------

W. Rabon re: TCC/Flagler A.B. lawsuit (.1);
 Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from E.
 Eunice re: FPSI student complaint (.2);
 Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FPSI
 student complaint (.1); E-mail to M.I. re:
 former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt
 and review of e-mail from M.I. re: former
 FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to R.
 Tolson re: FPSI student complaint (.1);
 Preparation of report re: former FPSI student
 complaint (3.9); Receipt and review of e-mails
 (5) from T. Smith re: Gadsden County
 property (.5); E-mail to T. Smith re: Gadsden
 County property (.1);

04/06/2011	BJL	Research Florida laws re veterans preference;	1.20 hrs.
04/06/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from W. Rabon re: A.B. TCC/Flagler case (.2); E-mail to W. Rabon re: A.B. TCC/Flagler case (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: FPSI student complaint (.1); Complete report on former FPSI student complaint (1.1); Review documents re: Gadsden County building (.3); Telephone conference with D. Waddell re: liability waivers (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson/D. Waddell re: report on former FPSI student complaint (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: FPSI student complaints, employee complaint (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee issue/complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from P. Taylor re: on-line test taking fraud (.1); E-mail to R. Frazier re: on-line test taking fraud (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Frazier re: on-line test taking fraud (.2); Receipt and review of meetings summary/staff complaint summary (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: report on former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from W. Patterson re: liability waiver forms (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson</p>	6.40 hrs.

re: report on former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: staff complaint/meeting summaries (.2); Analysis: liability waiver forms (.9); E-mail to W. Patterson re: liability waiver forms (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: Veteran's preference (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: Veteran's preference (.2); Conference with T. Smith, T. Stallworth, J. Schilling re: Gadsden property (.8); Conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues, Veteran's preference (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Coulter re: on-line test taking fraud (.1);

04/07/2011	BJL	Research re: employment guidelines;	0.30 hrs.
04/07/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of TCCPD incident forms re: A.B. v. Flager/TCC (.3); Preparation for conference re: FPSI student log list (.3); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: conference on FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Schilling re: Gadsden property (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: Gadsden property (.2); Receipt, review and analysis of Gadsden property documents (.8); Conference with E. Eunice, R. Tolson re: FPSI student complaints (1.0); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Turner re: M.E. lawsuit mediation (.2); E-mail to M. Turner re: M.E. lawsuit mediation (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: Gadsden property (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Stallworth re: Gadsden property (.2); E-mail to J. Schilling re: Gadsden property (.1); E-mail to T. Smith, others re: Gadsden property (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling/R. Tolson re: H.E. case mediation (.1); Analysis: Veteran's preference in hiring (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: ADA accommodation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Bush re: mediator in H.E. case (.1);</p>	4.60 hrs.

04/08/2011 WRM Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: Gadsden property (.3); E-mail to T. Smith, others re: Gadsden property (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: accommodation request (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: accommodation request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail to J. Schilling re: Gadsden property (.1); Review and analysis of Gadsden property legal documents (1.0); Analysis - lease, lease termination, property sale re: Gadsden Property (.4); Analysis - A.D.A. accommodation request - reasonableness, essential functions of job (.4); E-mail to S. Jefferson, S. Rowland, R. Tolson re: reasonable accommodation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Rowland re: accommodation request (.1); E-mail to S. Rowland re: accommodation request (.1); E-mail to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Telephone conference with M.I. re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mails (3) to J. Murdaugh re: former FPSI student complaint (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: accommodation request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mails (2) from M.I. re: former FPSI student complaint (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M.I. re: former student complaint (.1); Conference with T. Smith (phone), J. Schilling, T. Stallworth re: Gadsden property (.8); Telephone conference with E. Eunice re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from E. Eunice re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Review B. Holub's e-mail re: Wakulla Center lights (.1); E-mail to J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with S. Rowland re: former FPSI student complaint (.3); Review and analysis of definitions -

5.90 hrs.

dependents for benefits (.3);

04/11/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: Gadsden property (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: Gadsden property (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Schilling re: Gadsden property (.2); Conference with R. Tolson re: discrimination/harassment allegations (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: Gadsden property (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); E-mail to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Conference with E. Eunice re: former FPSI student complaint (.3); Telephone conference with M.I. former FPSI student complaint (.3);</p>	1.80 hrs.
04/12/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mail from M.I. re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Telephone conference with E. Eunice re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to M.I. re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M. Turner re: M.U. and H.E. lawsuits (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Bierbaum re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to B. Bierbaum re: former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Tolson re: ADA accommodation report (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Rowland re: ADA accommodation requests (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: ADA accommodation request (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: ADA accommodation request (.1); Review Florida statutory definitions - eligibility for tuition waiver (1.4); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to T. Smith re: Florida determination for entitlement to spouse tuition waiver (.3); Telephone conference with S. Oole re: Wakulla Center</p>	3.50 hrs.

lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: on-line course fraud allegation (.1); E-mail to R. Frazier re: on-line course fraud allegation (.1);

04/13/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from M.I. re: former FPSI student complaint (.2); E-mails (2) to M.I. former FPSI student complaint (.2); E-mails (2) to M.I. re: former FPSI student complaint (.2); E-mail to E. Eunice/B. Spiers re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from E. Eunice re: resolution of former FPSI complaint (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: contract renewal (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from Spiers re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee accommodation request (.1); Review, revise release/settlement agreement for resolution of form FPSI student claims (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: FLR nondisclosure agreement (.1); Review FLR nondisclosure agreement (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: FLR nondisclosure agreement (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: leases (.2); E-mails (2) to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M.I. re: former FPSI student complaint resolution (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: former FPSI student complaint resolution (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: accommodation request, contract renewal (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Telephone conference with E. Eunice re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mail to M.I. re: former FPSI student complaint resolution (.1);</p>	3.40 hrs.
04/14/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from E. Eunice re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.3); E-mails (2) to E. Eunice re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint</p>	1.70 hrs.

(.2); Telephone conference with E. Eunice re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.1); Review draft correspondence to former FPSI student (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turner re: M.E. lawsuit (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Easley re: Veteran's Clinic pharmacy internship (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of Veteran's Administration Clinic pharmacy internship agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: subpoena for records (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: subpoena for records (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: subpoena for records (.1); Conference with T. Smith re: employee issue, resolution of complaint (.3); E-mail to M.I. re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.1);

04/15/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mail from M.I. re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.1); E-mails (2) to M.I. re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.2); Receipt and review of EEOC determination in S.H. matter (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson/E. Eunice, others re: EEOC determination in S.H. matter (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with P. Hurley re: COT/TCC EMT training agreement (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: Follett Bookstore contract (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: Follett Bookstore contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from T. Smith re: Follett Bookstore contract (.3); E-mails (3) to T. Smith re: Follett Bookstore contract (.3); Telephone conference with T. Smith/C. Singletary re: subpoenas for IT information (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: COT/TCC EMT training agreement (.1); Conference with M.I. re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: COT/TCC EMT training agreement (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.1); Begin review and analysis of</p>	3.70 hrs.
------------	-----	---	-----------

proposed Follett contract (1.0); Dictation and preparation of memo to E. Eunice re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: resolution of former FPSI student complaint (.1);

04/18/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from M.I. re: FPSI uniform return (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Gadsen property (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Lesko re: EBSCO publishing license agreement (.2); Review and analysis of EBSCO publicly licensing agreement (.3); E-mail to B. Lesko re: EBSCO public license agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: LaRusso contract (.1); Review and analysis of LaRusso contract (.8); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: LaRusso contract (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: lease policy (.1); Telephone conference with E. Eunice re: M.I. matter resolution (.1);	2.10 hrs.
04/19/2011	WRM	E-mail to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to T. Smith re: LaRasso contract (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Rowland re: requested accommodation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Follett contract (.1); Complete review and analysis of Follett Bookstore proposed contract (1.2);Continued analysis - Veteran's preference in employment (.5);	2.30 hrs.
04/20/2011	WRM	Dictation and preparation of report to R. Tolson re: Veteran's preference (.9); Conference with R. Tolson, S. Rowland re: accommodation request (1.5); Conference with R. Tolson re: accommodation request (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Rowland re: accommodation request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from G. Wells re: course fees, fees for testing (.2); E-mail to G. Wells	4.50 hrs.

re: course fees, fees for testing (.1); E-mail to S. Rowland re: accommodation request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: course fees, fees for testing (.1); Conference with T. Smith/J. Schilling/M. Finkelstein re: Follett Bookstore contract (1.0); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turner re: M.U. lawsuit (.1);

04/21/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: accommodation request (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Rowland re: accommodation request (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: accommodation request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: student test fee (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: student test fee (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: SilkRoad agreements (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: Workforce Plus Contract (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: accommodation request, employee performance (.3); Review and analysis of Workforce Plus contract (.7); Telephone conference with R. Frazier re: Workforce Plus Contract (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith/J. Schilling re: exam fees, lab fees (.3); Review and analysis of SilkRoad agreements (.6); E-mail to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center Lease (.1); Analysis - permissibility of additional student fees (1.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Lesko re: American Psychiatric Publishing Agreement (.1);</p>	4.20 hrs.
04/22/2011	WRM	<p>Receipt, review and analysis of psychiatric online License Agreement (.4); E-mail to B. Lesko re: psychiatric online License Agreement (.1); Conference with S. Jefferson, S. Rowland, R. Tolson re: accommodation request (1.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: psychiatric online License Agreement (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: psychiatric online License Agreement (.1);</p>	2.00 hrs.

04/25/2011	WRM	E-mail to R. Frazier re: Workforce Plus Agreement (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); E-mail to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Lesko re: American Psy. Publishing agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from S. Rowland re: accommodation request (.2); Receipt and review of TCC Board Agenda for April 26, 2011 (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: accommodation request (.1); Receipt and review of proposed disability accommodations (.3); E-mails (2) to S. Rowland re: proposed disability accommodations (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee claim of discrimination (.2);	2.10 hrs.
04/26/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Frazier re: Workforce Plus agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: contract for immigration consultant (.1); E-mail to M. Iouanna re: FPSI uniform items (.1); E-mail to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.4); E-mails (2) to J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: new M.K. EEOC complaint (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center Lease (.2); Receipt and review of M.K. EEOC complaint (.2); Travel to and from Panacea for Board meeting (2.0); Attend Board workshop and business meeting (2.6);	6.30 hrs.
04/27/2011	BJL	Review and analysis of case law re: contract interpretation for leases (4.6); Review and analysis of contract language, addendums, correspondence and other documents (1.5); Prepare memo re: interpretation for leases (1.1);(re: Wakulla Center Lease)	7.20 hrs.
04/27/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Murdaugh re: Wakulla Center lease (.1);	4.90 hrs.

Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); E-mail to S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: employee lease questions (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Iovanna re: FPSI uniform items (.1); E-mail to E. Eunice re: FPSI uniform items (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with D. Minnis re: Gadsden property sub-lease (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Oole re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Analysis: TCC lease policies application to leave for part-time and probationary status employees (1.2); Continued analysis: Wakulla Center lease (.6); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: TCC lease policies (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Minnis re: Gadsden property sub-lease (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Gadsden property sub-lease (.2); E-mails (2) to T. Smith, others re: Gadsden property sub-lease (.2); Analysis of proposed sub-lease of Gadsden property to City of Quincy (.7); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Follett Bookstore contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Follett Bookstore contract (.1);

04/28/2011	BJL	Review and analysis of nuisance law;	0.90 hrs.
04/28/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mail re: FPSI uniform items (.1); E-mail to M. Iovanna re: FPSI uniform items (.1); Conference with T. Smith re: Follett Bookstore contract, Gadsden Property Sub-Lease (1.2); Conference with R. Tolson, H. Wright re: M.K. EEOC complaint, review hiring files (3), applicant file (1.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Follett Bookstore contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Sloan re: TCC Housing (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turnball re: TCC Housing (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re:	8.00 hrs.

Pro-Audio Visual contract (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: TCC Housing (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of Pro-Audio Visual contract (.2); E-mail to G. Wells re: Pro-Audio Visual contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: FAMU stormwater (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: FAMU stormwater (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: FAMU stormwater (.1); Receipt and review of EEOC notice of closing M.T. complaint file (.1); E-mail to D. Minnis re: Gadsden property sub-lease (.1); Review and analysis of most recent draft of Follett Bookstore contract (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: draft Follett Bookstore contract (.1); Telephone conference with S. Oole re: Wakulla Center Lease (.2); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from K. Gardner re: Brogan noise (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Brogan noise (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Norris re: Brogan noise (.1); Continued analysis of Wakulla Center lease (1.9); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Brogan noise (.1); E-mail to J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Stallworth re: Brogan noise (.2); Review - nuisance concept re: Brogan noise (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: Brogan noise, Follett contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Finkelstein re: Follett contract (.1);

04/29/2011	BJL	Review and analysis of case law re: private nuisance claims, measurement of damages, and affirmative defenses (2.8); Conference with Bill Mabile re: nuisance (.3);	3.10 hrs.
04/29/2011	WRM	Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: draft Follett contract (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Brogan noise (.1); Receipt and review of email from T. Stallworth re: FAMU stormwater (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Analysis: Brogan	4.50 hrs.

noise, nuisance (.3); Review Florida Statutes re: Board voting requirements (.5); Telephone conference with L. Kling re: Board voting (.1); Telephone conference with E. Lamb re: Board voting (.2); Review and analysis of draft Follett contract - version to be forwarded to Follett (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Finkelstein re: draft Follett contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Tolson re: M.K. FCHR complaint (.2); E-mails (2) to R. Tolson re: M.K. FCHR complaint (.2); Telephone conference with J. Chapin re: Wakulla Center lease (.1); Analysis: law related to Brogan noise (1.8); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Powell re: M.K. FCHR complaint (.1); Review M.K. FCHR documents (.2);

April Flat Fee

\$13,333.33

BILLING SUMMARY

Longfellow, B. Joe	Associate	12.70 hrs	
Mabile, William R	Attorney	94.30 hrs	
Fees		107.00 hrs	<hr/> \$13,333.33
Disbursements			\$0.00
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL			<hr/> \$13,333.33