



May 17, 2010

MEMORANDUM

TO: District Board of Trustees
FROM: Barbara R. Sloan, President *BRS*
SUBJECT: Attorney Invoice - Andrews, Crabtree, Knox & Andrews, LLP

Item Description:

Request for approval to pay the Board's attorney.

Overview:

On a monthly basis, the Board's attorney submits an invoice for services provided.

Salient Facts:

The College's attorney is hired by the Board under the authority of Section 1001.64(25), Florida Statutes, and for this reason invoices are brought for approval.

Past Actions:

Attorney fees and expenses charged in fiscal year 2009-2010, through 4/30/2010 total \$129,020.92.

Future Actions:

Monthly Invoices will be presented as they are submitted by the attorney.

Funding/Financial Matters:

Funding is budgeted in Fund 1, the Current Unrestricted Fund. The current amount due is \$16,190.00.

Staff Resource:

Teresa Smith

Recommended Action:

Authorize payment of invoices as presented.

ANDREWS, CRABTREE, KNOX & ANDREWS, LLP

P.O. BOX 12800
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32317
TAX ID #59-3621660

May 3, 2010

Jerry Schilling
Assistant Vice President for Administrative Services
Tallahassee Community College
444 Appleyard Drive
Tallahassee, FL 32304

Invoice# 9112 WRM
Our file# T00007 02276
Billing through 04/30/2010

Tallahassee Community College (General)

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|--------|
| 04/01/2010 | WRM | Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee dispute resolution, K.M. EEOC mediation (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Johnston re: Wakulla property transfer (.3); E-mails (2) to F. Lowe re: Wakulla property transfer (.2); E-mails (2) to R. Johnston re: Wakulla Property Transfer (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from F. Lowe re: Wakulla Property Transfer (.1); Telephone conference with T. Stallworth re: Ryder Bldg., lease, Wakulla property (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail to T. Stallworth re: Ryder Bldg. Lease (.1); Review and analysis of revisions to Ryder Bldg. Lease (.3); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: revisions to Ryder Bldg. Lease (.1); Telephone conference with S. Stephens re: DOC facility at PSTI (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: DOC facility at PSTI (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: DOC facility at PSTI (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: Wakulla Prop. transfer (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee discipline, on going litigation (.4); Telephone conference with B. Law re: TCC policy interpretation (.1); | 2.70 hrs. | 405.00 |
| 04/02/2010 | WRM | Telephone conference with L. Kling re: policy interpretation (.1); Telephone conference with | 4.00 hrs. | 600.00 |

B. Law re: policy interpretations (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: employees issue (.5); Analysis - policies, admin rules, statutes re: employee questions, conformity of policy (1.3); Review human resource records re: employee issues (.9); Conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues, student complaint (.4); Telephone conference with J. Diaz re: K.M. EEOC mediation (.1); Telephone conference with B. Jett re: K.M. EEOC mediation (.1); Telephone conference with M. Cramer re: stormwater impact fees (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: stormwater impact fees (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. McKenzie re: faculty office hours (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: faculty office hours (.1);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|--------|
| 04/05/2010 | WRM | <p>Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: employee complaint (2 calls) (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from J. Murdaugh re: L.Z. suit (.2); Telephone conferences with L. Kling re: policy question (2 calls) (.2); Telephone conference with B. Law re: policy questions (.2); Review and analysis of PSAV/DOT Agreement (.4); E-mail to T. Smith re: PSAV/DOT Agreement (.1); Telephone conference with S. Stephens re: DOC Re-entry Facility (.1); Telephone conference with B. Jett re: K.M. EEOC matter mediation (.1); E-mail to J. Murdaugh re: L.Z. suit (.1); Telephone conference with J. Diaz re: K.M. EEOC matter mediation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Dominguez re: business associates agreements (.1); Review provisions of GINA and HiTech acts re: application for college (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Quillen/C. Dominguez re: Community College attorneys communications (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Moore re: whistleblower vender (.1);</p> | 2.30 hrs. | 345.00 |
| 04/06/2010 | WRM | <p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from P. Manning re: Perkins Skills Attainment survey</p> | 1.30 hrs. | 195.00 |

(.2); E-mail to P. Manning re: Perkins Skills Attainment survey (.1); Telephone conference with J. Diaz re: K.M. EEOC matter mediation (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: K.M. EEOC matter mediation (.1); Telephone conference with L. Kling re: meeting with B. Law (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Kling re: meeting with B. Law (.1); E-mail to L. Kling re: meeting with B. Law (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Morris re: contract renewal (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. McKenzie re: office hours (.1); Review and analysis of Florida Admin. Code re: contract renewal and office hours (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Dominguez re: contract renewal (.1);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|--------|
| 04/07/2010 | BJL | Review and analysis of employee issues and investigations; | 1.10 hrs. | 165.00 |
| 04/07/2010 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Kling re: meeting with B. Law/T. Smith (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from T. Smith re: meeting with B. Law (.3); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: meeting with B. Law (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Lupe re: faculty office hours (.1); Analysis of Carl Perkins Act 1998/2006 reporting requirements (1.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. McKenzie re: continuing contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Koehler re: faculty office hours (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee dispute resolution documentation (.2); Conference with R. Tolson re: documents to be produced per public records request, employee issues (.9); Review documents to be produced per public records request (.5); Follow-up analysis - employee issue (.3); Analysis Board member meetings with staff (.4); Conference with K. Moore, B. Law re: college future (1.8); | 6.40 hrs. | 960.00 |
| 04/08/2010 | WRM | Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: recruiting question, hiring process , employee | 0.70 hrs. | 105.00 |

issues (.3); Analysis: recruiting question, hiring process (.4);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|--------|
| 04/09/2010 | BJL | Continued review and analysis of employee issues and employee investigations; | 0.70 hrs. | 105.00 |
| 04/09/2010 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from H. Edwards re: 4/12/10 meeting with B. Law/T. Smith (.1); E-mail to H. Edwards re: 4/12/10 meeting with B. Law/T. Smith (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: Capital City Challenge Agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Gautier re: AMTC Lease/Sublease (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: recruiting requirement (.1); Review Capital City Challenge Agreement (.2); E-mail to G. Wells re: Capital City Challenge Agreement (.1); Telephone conference with J. Schilling re: service contract question (.1); Analysis: service procurement, recruitment consultant services, meetings in sunshine (3.1); E-mail to K. Moore re: information, contact (.1); Telephone conference with K. Moore re: information dissemination (.1); | 4.30 hrs. | 645.00 |
| 04/12/2010 | WRM | Analysis - interplay of Perkins Act data requirement and Florida law public records act (.1); Conference with P. Manning re: legal analysis of collection of information for Perkins skills inventory (.5); Conference with T. Smith re: services producent standard (.2); Telephone conference with K. Moore re: potential issues (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Moore re: potential issues (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: intellectual property question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Moore re: potential leadership change (.1); E-mail to K. Moore re: potential leadership change (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Jefferson re: Civic Center contract (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: screening committee information (.1); Review Civic Center | 5.00 hrs. | 750.00 |

graduation contract (.3); E-mail to S. Jefferson re: Civic Center contract (.1); Conference with B. Law, T. Smith, others re: proposed public/private agreement (.7); Conference with B. Sloan re: two employee issues (.5); Analysis - recruiting, advertising, and hiring process questions (1.7);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|----------|
| 04/13/2010 | WRM | <p>Telephone conference with M. Hooks re: TCC/another college agreement (.1); Telephone conferences with (4) from K. Moore re: Board procedures (.4); E-mails (5) to B. Dillon re: public/private partnership (.5); Telephone conference with S. Stephens re: DOC Re-entry Facility (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (5) from B. Dillon re: public/private partnership (.5); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: DOC Re-entry Facility (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: DOC Re-entry Facility (.1); Review and analysis of Florida Statutes/Rules re: proposed public/private partnership (1.0); Review program agreement, contract, FCC Order, Rural Health proposal re: public/private partnership (1.8); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: proposed public/private partnership (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: proposed public/private partnership (.2); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: proposed public/private partnership (.3); Review and analysis of process/procedure re: selection of President (1.8); Conference with R. Doster re: process/production used for selection of President - 2001-2002 (1.5); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: St. Petersburg decision (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: St. Petersburg decision (.1); Telephone conference with B. Hebrock re: graduation requirements (.1);</p> | 9.00 hrs. | 1,350.00 |
| 04/14/2010 | WRM | <p>Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: meeting on public/private partnership (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: meeting on public/private partnership (.1);</p> | 6.30 hrs. | 945.00 |

Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Moore re: President Law (.1); Telephone conferences with (2) with S. Rowland re: graduation requirements (.2); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee issues resolution (.1); Review on-line graduation requirements (.2); Review TCC policy re: employee issues (.1); Review documents re: employee issues (.3); Conference with R. Tolson, S. Search re: employee issues (.9); Conference with R. Tolson re: employee actions (.5); Conference with S. Rowland re: graduation requirements (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from K. Moon re: President's contract (.2); E-mail to B. Hebrock re: graduation requirement (.1); E-mails (2) to K. Moon re: President's contract (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: past President selection process (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hebrock re: graduation requirement (.1); Review communications re: inter-departmental dispute (.3); Review and analysis of statute, policy, rules, A.G. opinions re: potential disciplinary action (2.0); Telephone conference with K. Moore re: President selection (.1);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|--------|
| 04/15/2010 | BJL | Research Sunshine laws and recent case law on its interpretations; | 0.70 hrs. | 105.00 |
| 04/16/2010 | WRM | Complete Sunshine Law analysis - application to ad hoc committees (2.4); Preparation for today's meeting re: proposed public/private partnership (.3); E-mails (3) to F. Lowe re: Wakulla property Transfer (.3); Telephone conferences (3) with R. Tolson re: Sunshine law application (.3); Review and analysis of provisions of President's current contract (.3); Analysis: President's selection questions (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from F. Lowe re: Wakulla Property Transfer (.2); Telephone conference with K. Moon re: President's contract (.2); Telephone conference with K. Moore re: Presidential succession (.1); Conference with T. Smith, B. Dillon re: | 5.90 hrs. | 885.00 |

proposed public/private partnership (.5);
Conference with B. Sloan, R. Tolson re:
interviewing process, Sunshine Law questions
(1.0);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|----------|
| 04/18/2010 | WRM | Telephone conferences with K. Moore re: Presidential transition (2 calls) (.4); Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: various human resources issues (2 calls) (.5); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Turner re: H.E. whistleblower suit (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: President's retirement compensation (.2); Review policies re: non-renewal compare contract, compare with rule and statute (.6); Dictation and preparation of correspondence to R. Tolson re: non-renewal of contract, right to appeal (.3); Telephone conference with B. Hebrock re: Presidential transition (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from B. Hebrock re: Presidential transition (.1); Telephone conference with K. Moon re: Presidential transition (.6); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: President's compensation (.1); E-mail to B. Law re: President's compensation (.1); E-mail to K. Moore re: President's contract (.1); Analysis Sunshine act - application to college committees (3.1); Analysis: proposed disciplinary action (1.2); | 7.70 hrs. | 1,155.00 |
| 04/19/2010 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employment interviews, Sunshine law question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Dental Clinic Establishment Application (.1); Review and analysis of reports, other documents re: reconsideration of employee status (1.0); Memo to R. Tolson re: reconsideration of employee status (.3); Review and analysis of documents, rules, statutes re: Dental Clinic Establishment application (1.0); Telephone conferences (2) with T. Smith re: Dental Clinic Establishment Application (.2); E-mail to B. Mallowney re: Sunshine Law question (.1); Telephone | 7.50 hrs. | 1,125.00 |

conferences (4) with T. Smith re: Presidential compensation (.4); E-mail to R. Johnston re: Wakulla property Transfer (.1); Telephone conferences (3) with R. Tolson re: President's Compensation and employee action (.3); Telephone conferences (2) with K. Moore re: Presidential transition (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: financial/contractual obligations (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Tolson re: contractual obligations (.3); Telephone conference with L. Kling re: Board contract information (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Kling re: Board contact information (.1); Review President compensation calculation (.2); E-mail to R. Tolson re: President's compensation calculations (.1); E-mails (2) to L. Kling re: Board contact information (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: Wakulla property Transfer (.1); Telephone conferences (3) with A. Defoor re: contract obligation (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Dillon re: proposed public/private partnership (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: Presidential transfer (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) to L. Kling re: Board contact information (.2); Conference with T. Smith/R. Tolson re: Presidential compensation (.5); Conference with R. Tolson re: several employee issues (.5); Telephone conference with J. Hockaday re: Presidential recruitment (.2); Revise Wakulla property Transfer documents (.4);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|--------|
| 04/20/2010 | WT | Telephone conference with K. Moon re: President's lease compensation; | 0.20 hrs. | 10.00 |
| 04/20/2010 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Mallowney re: Sunshine Law question (.1); E-mail to B. Mallowney re: Sunshine Law question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from T. Smith re: proposed public/possible partnership (.2); E-mail to T. Smith re: proposed public/private partnership (.1); | 3.30 hrs. | 495.00 |

Prepare revisions to Wakulla property transfer documents (.3); Telephone conference with K. Moore/B. Law re: college issues (.6); Telephone conference with T. Smith re: college issues (.3); E-mail to Board re: President leave payout (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with K. Moon re: President's leave payout (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: contract obligations (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Moon re: contract obligations (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with B. Law re: President's Leave and payout (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: revised Community Education lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Defoor re: Sunshine Law question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: Sunshine Law question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails from A. Maxwell re: public records request re: class averages (.2); E-mails (2) to A. Maxwell re: public records request (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee discipline (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Callen re: President's leave payout (.1);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|--------|
| 04/21/2010 | WT | Revise agreements/deed between TCC Foundation and Wakulla Expo; | 0.40 hrs. | 20.00 |
| 04/21/2010 | BJL | Review and analysis of case re: Sunshine law to prepare a memo re: its application; | 0.70 hrs. | 105.00 |
| 04/21/2010 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Callen re: President's leave payout (.1); E-mail to D. Callen re: President lease payout (.1); Telephone conferences with (2) R. Tolson re: proposed disciplinary action (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from F. Lowe re: Wakulla property transfer (.1); Telephone conferences (3) with A. Maxwell re: grade information public record request (.3); Receipt and review of Wakulla transfer documents received from F. Lowe (.2); E-mails (2) to F. Lowe re: | 5.80 hrs. | 870.00 |

Wakulla property transfer (.2); E-mails (2) to R. Johnston re: Wakulla property transfer (.2); Review, revise Wakulla deed and property transfer documents (1.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: Wakulla property transfer (.1); E-mail to T. Smith re: proposed public/private partnership (.1); Telephone conference with B. Sloan re: public record request for grade information (.1); Review 4/20/10 revisions to Ryder building lease (.3); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: revisions to Ryder building lease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: proposed public/private partnership (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (3) from R. Johnston re: Wakulla property transfer (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: public record request for grade information (.1); Receipt and review of public record request for class averages (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Weidner re: Wakulla property transfer (.1); Telephone conferences with T. Smith re: proposed public/private partnership (.3); E-mail to B. Hebrock re: President's compensation questions (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: Ryder Building lease (.1); Telephone conference with K. Moon re: President's lease compensation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Hebrock re: President's compensation questions (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Defoor re: Sunshine Law Board e-mails (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Moore re: next Board meeting - President search (.1); Telephone conference with T. Smith, B. Dillon re: proposed public/private partnership (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail, K. Moore re: Sunshine Law - Board e-mails (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: class averages public record request (.1); Telephone conference with A. DeFoor re: Sunshine Law - Board discussion (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: several employee issues

(.2); E-mail to K. Moon re: Sunshine Law - Board discussion (.1);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|--|-----------|--------|
| 04/22/2010 | BJL | Continue researching case law, and attorney general opinions on interpretations of Sunshine law to prepare memo re: its application (1.9); Prepare memo re: application of Sunshine law (.9); | 2.80 hrs. | 420.00 |
| 04/22/2010 | WRM | Analysis - employee hire H-1B visa (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from A. Maxwell re: public record request (.1); E-mail to A. Maxwell re: public record request (.1); Telephone conference with B. Sloan re: public record request (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: public record request (.1); E-mail to G. Wells re: PSAV/DOT contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from F. Lowe re: Wakulla property transfer (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with R. Tolson re: employee discipline (.2); Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: Wakulla property transfer (.2); E-mails (3) to F. Lowe re: Wakulla property transfer (.3); E-mail to R. Johnston re: Wakulla property transfer (.1); E-mail to F. Snyder re: Sunshine Law question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: Wakulla property transfer (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of Chapter 119 - public records, re: public record request for class averages (.7); Telephone conference with A. Maxwell re: public record request for class grade averages (.1); E-mail to B. Sloan re: class grade average public records request (.1); Review legislation re: Section 768.28, sovereign immunity damages caps (.1); E-mail to J. Schilling re: amendment to Section 768.28 (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: green card job applicant, contract question, employee actions (.3); Telephone conference with F. Snyder re: Sunshine Law question (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from J. Schilling re: amendment to Section 768.28 (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from | 5.40 hrs. | 810.00 |

G. Wells re: PSAV/DOT contract (.1);
 Conference with F. Snyder re: Sunshine Law
 (1.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B.
 Sloan re: public record report (.1); E-mail to K.
 Moore re: F. Snyder, consultant (.1); Review
 Agenda for April 26 Board meeting (.5);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|----------|
| 04/23/2010 | BJL | Revise and edit memo on application of Sunshine laws (.5); Discuss with Bill Mabile application of Sunshine laws as to modern technology (.3); | 0.80 hrs. | 120.00 |
| 04/23/2010 | WRM | E-mail to R. Tolson re: H-1B visa status employees (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from F. Snyder re: Sunshine Law (.1); Analysis - public record request for test and exam issue (.9); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: PSAV/DOT contract (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: employee dispute mediation, retirement payout question (.2); Telephone conference with S. Hall re: public record request - grade averages (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from G. Wells re: Fabulous Coachlines contract (.1); Review and analysis of Fabulous Coachlines contract (.2); E-mail to G. Wells re: Fabulous Coachlines contact (.1); Receipt and review of memo re: Sunshine Law - Board member contract (.1); Telephone conference with K. Moore re: Sunshine Law presentation, Board Agenda, possible retreat (.3); E-mails (2) to T. Smith re: budget questions (.2); Telephone conference with F. Snyder re: Sunshine Law (.1); Conference with F. Snyder re: Sunshine Law (1.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Smith re: budget questions (.1); E-mail to K. Young re: Sunshine Law presentation (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from K. Moore re: Sunshine Law presentation (.1); Receipt and review of notice of hearing in H.E. whistleblower case (.1); E-mail to M. Turner re: H.E. whistleblower case (.1); | 4.30 hrs. | 645.00 |
| 04/26/2010 | WRM | Telephone conferences (2) with B. Hebrock re: | 8.30 hrs. | 1,245.00 |

Board workshop - 4/26/10 (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with K. Moore re: Board workshop 4/26/10 (.3); Telephone conferences (3) with J. Schilling re: TCC website communications (.3); Receipt and review of e-mail from F. Snyder re: information technology and Sunshine Law (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: employee H-1B visa (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: employee H-1B visa (.1); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: discipline and grievance (.1); E-mail to Board members re: discussion board (.1); E-mail to T. Smith/J. Schilling re: Attorney General Sunshine Technology Team (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from D. Callen re: discussion board (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Gautier re: lease/sublease - AMTC building (.2); E-mails (2) to R. Gautier re: lease/sublease AMTC building (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with L. Kling re: execution/witness of AMTC building lease (.2); Telephone conference with B. Mallowney re: Sunshine Law question (.1); Telephone conference with S. Stephens re: DOC Re-entry Facility (.1); E-mail to T. Stallworth re: DOC contact for Re-entry facility (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Stallworth re: DOC re-entry facility (.1); Telephone conference with B. Law re: Board voting practices (.1); E-mail to B. Hebrock re: Board workshop and meeting (.1); Telephone conference with B. Law re: lease/sublease AMTC building (.1); Telephone conference with F. Snyder re: Sunshine Law presentation (.1); E-mail to B. Hebrock re: Sunshine Law question (.1); Review and analysis of questions re: meetings, other contacts and Sunshine Law (.7); Conference with B. Law, F. Snyder re: Sunshine Law (.4); Conference with K. Moore, F. Snyder, Sunshine Law application to Presidential search (.2); Attend Board workshop (1.5); Attend Board meeting (2.5);

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|--------|
| 04/27/2010 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from C. Sciame re: AMTC building lease, sublease (.1); E-mail to L. Kling re: noticing of sub-committee meetings (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: survey of Wakulla property (.1); E-mail to F. Lowe re: Wakulla property survey (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from L. Kling re: AMTC building lease and sublease (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Law re: signature authority (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: rejection of job candidate (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from F. Snyder re: discussion board (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from B. Sloan re: Interim President Contract (.1); E-mail to A. Defoor/F. Messersmith re: Interim President's contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Rowland re: state employee fee waiver (.1); | 1.20 hrs. | 180.00 |
| 04/28/2010 | WT | Preparation of correspondence to K. Moon and A. Defoor re: Dr. Law's contract; | 0.20 hrs. | 10.00 |
| 04/28/2010 | WRM | E-mail to L. Kling re: AMTC lease/sublease (.1); Receipt, review and analysis of correspondence from R.M., candidate for faculty position re: revocation of job offer (.1); Telephone conference with R. Doster re: Presidential selections process (.3); Telephone conferences (2) with B. Hebrock re: Sunshine law consultant (.2); Telephone conferences (2) with J. Schilling re: signature authority (.2); E-mail to P. Farrell re: sub-committee meeting site (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from P. Farrell re: sub-committee meeting site (.2); E-mail to S. Rowland re: state employee fee waiver (.1); E-mail to S. McKenzie re: Interim President Contract (.1); Telephone conference with B. Mulowney re: Sunshine law interview question (.2); Telephone conference with E. Lamb re: budget sub-committee public notice (.1); Telephone conferences (2) with L. Kling re: Board | 2.00 hrs. | 300.00 |

| | | | | |
|------------|-----|---|-----------|----------|
| | | sub-committee meeting minutes (.2); Telephone conference with R. Johnston re: Wakulla property survey (.1); | | |
| 04/29/2010 | WT | Telephone conference with B. Jett at EEOC re: confidentiality agreement; | 0.20 hrs. | 10.00 |
| 04/29/2010 | WRM | Telephone conferences with R. Tolson re: contract employee and records production (2 calls); | 0.20 hrs. | 30.00 |
| 04/30/2010 | BJL | Review and analysis of Sunshine law re: access to meetings; | 0.40 hrs. | 60.00 |
| 04/30/2010 | WRM | Receipt and review of e-mail from S. McKenzie re: interim President contract (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from S. Rowland re: state employee tuitions waiver (.1); Telephone conference with K. Moore re: Presidential question (.3); Receipt and review of e-mails (4) from F. Lowe re: Wakulla property survey (.4); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: Presidential search consultants (.1); E-mail to E. Lamb/F. Messersuite re: Presidential search consultants (.1); E-mail to F. Messersmith/A. Defoor re: interim President's contract (.1); E-mail to TCC Board re: minutes of Board Sub-Committees (.1); E-mails (2) to R. Johnston re: Wakulla property survey (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Tolson re: state attorney subpoena for employee's records (.1); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from L. Kling re: public meeting at facility charging entrance fee (.2); E-mails (2) to L. Kling re: public meeting at facility changing entrance fee (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from T. Folsom re: radio announcement agreement (.1); E-mail to T. Folsom re: radio announcement agreement (.1); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Johnston re: Wakulla property survey (.1); E-mails (2) to F. Lowe re: Wakulla property survey (.2); E-mail to B. Sloan re: faculty screening committees (.1); | 6.80 hrs. | 1,020.00 |

Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: subpoena for records (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: interview committees (.1); Review documents to be produced in H.E. whistleblower case, review subpoena for employee file, review employee file for possible action (2.3); Conference with R. Tolson re: document requests disciplinary action, applicant non-hire (.5); Telephone conference with R. Tolson re: proposed employee action (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from R. Murgo re: visiting instructor (.1); E-mail to R. Murgo re: visiting instructor (.1); E-mail to R. Tolson re: proposed employee action (.2); Receipt and review of e-mail from M. Finklestein re: visiting instructor (.2); Receipt and review of e-mails (2) from R. Johnston re: foundation real property gift policy (.2); Review Foundation real property gift policy (.1); E-mail to R. Johnston re: Foundation real property gift policy (.1);

Fees for this matter

\$16,190.00

BILLING SUMMARY

| | | | | |
|--------------------|-----------|------------|------------|-------------|
| Longfellow, B. Joe | Associate | 7.20 hrs | 150.00 /hr | \$1,080.00 |
| Mabile, William R | Attorney | 100.40 hrs | 150.00 /hr | \$15,060.00 |
| Taylor, Winifred | Paralegal | 1.00 hrs | 50.00 /hr | \$50.00 |
| Fees | | 108.60 hrs | | \$16,190.00 |

Disbursements

\$0.00

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

\$16,190.00

| | |
|--|-------------------|
| Fees Billed Fiscal Year to Date | 123,971.10 |
| Expenses Billed Fiscal Year to Date | 5,049.82 |
| Fees Received Fiscal Year to Date | 124,922.00 |
| Expenses Received Fiscal Year to Date | 5,363.47 |